New Hampshire ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICE
Employment 32 SourH Main STREET
Security Concorp, NH 03301-4857

www.nhes.nh.gov
Were working fo keep New Hampshire working”

GEORGE N. COPADIS, CoMMISSIONER
November 4, 2013

Her Excellency, Governor Margaret Wood Hassan
and the Honorable Council
State House

Concord, NH 03301
REQUESTED ACTION

To authorize New Hampshire Employment Security (NHES) to enter into a contract with East Coast Security Services, Inc.
(VC# 156851), Salem, NH in the amount not to exceed $95,668.00 for fire, burglar, panic, and AC/DC fault alarm testing,
monitoring and maintenance as well as| building access control system monitoring and maintenance at NHES’s offices
statewide from December 1, 2013 through November 30, 2016. 100% Federal funds.

Federal funds available for these services will be expended as follows, contingent upon availability and continued
appropriations for fiscal years 2014 forward with the authority to adjust encumbrances in each of the State fiscal years through
the Budget Office if needed and justified:

02 - 27 - 27 - 270010 - 8040 DEPT OF EMPLOYMENT SECURITY

: FY 2014 FY 2015 FY 2016 FY2017
10 - 02700 - 80400000 - 048 - 500226 ContractRepairs. § 2309500 § 25961.65 § :3255800 $ 14,05335
Building & Grounds
Vendor Code: 156851 East Coast Security Setvices, Inc.
RQ# 142425
EXPLANATION

NHES is requesting approval of the attached contract for fire, burglar, panic, and AC/DC fault alarm testing, monitoring and
maintenance as well as building access control system monitoring and maintenance at NHES’s offices statewide. The contract
total of $95,668.00 ($31,020 for the first year, $30,920 for the second year and $33,728 for the third year) is for the period
beginning December 1, 2013 through November 30, 2016.

A competitive bid process was undertaken for fire, burglar, panic, and AC/DC fault alarm testing, monitoting and
maintenance as well as building access control system monitoring and maintenance at NHES’s offices statewide. A “Request
For Proposal” (RFP) was sent to seventeen (17) vendors, twelve (12) of which were obtained from an agency database and
five (5) that had responded to our advertisements. Of those seventeen (17) vendors, one (1) vendor submitted a bid. A
review of the submitted bid resulted in the selection of the only responding bidder. An RFP list with bid and non-bid

responses is attached.

Sincerely,

Diioh e

Gebrge N. Copadis

Commissioner

GNC/jdr

NHES is a proud member of America’s Workforce Network and NH Works. NHES is an Equal Opportunity Employer and complies with the
Americans with Disabilities Act. Auxiliary aids and services are available upon request of individuals with disabilities

Telephone (603) 224-3311 Fax (603) 228-4145 TDD/ TTY Access: Relay NH 1-800-735-2964 Web site: www.nhes.nh.gov
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Fire & Burglar Alarm & DSC& S2 Systems Testing, Maintenance, Monitoring

Subject:
—— .
AGREEMENT
The State of New Hampshire and the Contractor hereby mutually agree as follows:
GENERAL PROVISIONS

1. IDENTIFICATION.
1.1 State Agency Name

1.2 State Agency Address

32 South Main Street, Concord, NH 03301

NH Employment Security

1.3 Contractor Name 1.4 Contractor Address

East Coast Security Services, Inc. VC #156851B001 68 Stiles Road, Salem, NH, 03079
1.5 Contractor Phone 1.6 Account Number 1.7 Completion Date 1.8 Price Limitation

Number
I 603-458-6511 | | o010-027-8040-0048-0226 November 30, 2016 $95,668.00
1.9 Contracting Officer for State Agency 1.10 State Agency Telephone Number

George N. Copadis, Commissioner 603 228-4000
) )

1.12 Name and Title of Contractor Signatory

, Ltk L Depove. St s v
1.13 Acknowledgen#nt: State of EEE, County of _ﬁaﬁﬂﬁﬂﬁf i

On l /04~ 1\ \3 1 , before the undersigned officer, personally appeared the pgrson 1dent1f1ed in block 1.12, or satisfactorily
proven to be the person whose name is signed in block 1.11, and acknowledged that s/he #gd})cumem in the capacity

1.

indicated in block 1.12. \ yeetreteL s .a,v
1.13.1 Signature of Notary Public or Justice of the Peage s‘\Q.." MY RN .,
W Z §{ EXPRES § =
[Seal] '-3. -‘. MAY 1,2018“-5 s
1.13.2 Name and Title of Notary or Justice of the Peace 4/A Ox, :g\?.’ $

-------

,/h "aggsss®
Downt Kershwe) | Moterf A HARERS

1.15 Name and Title of State Agency Signatory

1.14 State Agency Si ature J

George N. Copadis, Commissioner
e /ﬂ ’W/ 9 b

1.16 Approval by the N.H. Department of Administration, Division of Personnel (if applicable)

By: Director, On:

)

1.17 Approval by t twrney Gengeral (Form, Substance and Execution)

By: — On 1 //"3
1.18 Appyoyal by ovegdor and Executive Council
By, On:
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2. EMPLOYMENT OF CONTRACTOR/SERVICES TO
BE PERFORMED. The State of New Hampshire, acting
through the agency identified in block 1.1 (“$tate”), engages
contractor identified in block 1.3 (“Contractor”) to perform,

and the Contractor shall perform, the work o

r sale of goods, or

both, identified and more particularly described in the attached

EXHIBIT A which is incorporated herein by
(“Services”).

reference

3. EFFECTIVE DATE/COMPLETION OF SERVICES.
3.1 Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the
contrary, and subject to the approval of the Governor and
Executive Council of the State of New Hampshire, this

Agreement, and all obligations of the parties

hereunder, shall

not become effective until the date the Governor and

Executive Council approve this Agreement (
3.2 If the Contractor commences the Service

‘Effective Date™).
5 prior to the

Effective Date, all Services performed by the Contractor prior
to the Effective Date shall be performed at the sole risk of the
Contractor, and in the event that this Agreement does not
become effective, the State shall have no liability to the

Contractor, including without limitation, any
the Contractor for any costs incurred or Serv

obligation to pay
ces performed.

Contractor must complete all Services by the Completion Date

specified in block 1.7.

4. CONDITIONAL NATURE OF AGREEMENT.

Notwithstanding any provision of this Agree
contrary, all obligations of the State hereund

ment to the
er, including,

without limitation, the continuance of payments hereunder, are
contingent upon the availability and continugd appropriation

of funds, and in no event shall the State be li
payments hereunder in excess of such availa
funds. In the event of a reduction or termina
appropriated funds, the State shall have the r
payment until such funds become available,

have the right to terminate this Agreement in
giving the Contractor notice of such terminat
shall not be required to transfer funds from a
to the Account identified in block 1.6 in the ¢
Account are reduced or unavailable.

5. CONTRACT PRICE/PRICE LIMITAT
PAYMENT.
5.1 The contract price, method of payment, 4
payment are identified and more particularly
EXHIBIT B which is incorporated herein by
5.2 The payment by the State of the contract

able for any

ble appropriated
tion of

ght to withhold

f ever, and shall
nmediately upon
ion. The State
ny other account
>vent funds in that

[TON/

nd terms of
described in
reference.

price shall be the

only and the complete reimbursement to the Contractor for all

expenses, of whatever nature incurred by the
performance hereof, and shall be the only an
compensation to the Contractor for the Servi
shall have no liability to the Contractor other
price.
5.3 The State reserves the right to offset fron
otherwise payable to the Contractor under th
those liquidated amounts required or permitt
80:7 through RSA 80:7-c or any other provis

Contractor in the
d the complete
ces. The State
than the contract

1 any amounts

s Agreement

ed by N.H. RSA
ion of law.

Page 2 of 4

5.4 Notwithstanding any provision in this Agreement to the
contrary, and notwithstanding unexpected circumstances, in
no event shall the total of all payments authorized, or actually
made hereunder, exceed the Price Limitation set forth in block
1.8.

6. COMPLIANCE BY CONTRACTOR WITH LAWS
AND REGULATIONS/ EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY.

6.1 In connection with the performance of the Services, the
Contractor shall comply with all statutes, laws, regulations,
and orders of federal, state, county or municipal authorities
which impose any obligation or duty upon the Contractor,
including, but not limited to, civil rights and equal opportunity
laws. In addition, the Contractor shall comply with all
applicable copyright laws.

6.2 During the term of this Agreement, the Contractor shall
not discriminate against employees or applicants for
employment because of race, color, religion, creed, age, sex,
handicap, sexual orientation, or national origin and will take
affirmative action to prevent such discrimination.

6.3 If this Agreement is funded in any part by monies of the
United States, the Contractor shall comply with all the
provisions of Executive Order No. 11246 (“Equal
Employment Opportunity”), as supplemented by the
regulations of the United States Department of Labor (41
C.F.R. Part 60), and with any rules, regulations and guidelines
as the State of New Hampshire or the United States issue to
implement these regulations. The Contractor further agrees to
permit the State or United States access to any of the
Contractor’s books, records and accounts for the purpose of
ascertaining compliance with all rules, regulations and orders,
and the covenants, terms and conditions of this Agreement.

7. PERSONNEL.

7.1 The Contractor shall at its own expense provide all
personnel necessary to perform the Services. The Contractor
warrants that all personnel engaged in the Services shall be
qualified to perform the Services, and shall be properly
licensed and otherwise authorized to do so under all applicable
laws.

7.2 Unless otherwise authorized in writing, during the term of
this Agreement, and for a period of six (6) months after the
Completion Date in block 1.7, the Contractor shall not hire,
and shall not permit any subcontractor or other person, firm or
corporation with whom it is engaged in a combined effort to
perform the Services to hire, any person who is a State
employee or official, who is materially involved in the
procurement, administration or performance of this
Agreement. This provision shall survive termination of this
Agreement.

7.3 The Contracting Officer specified in block 1.9, or his or
her successor, shall be the State’s representative. In the event
of any dispute concerning the interpretation of this Agreement,
the Contracting Officer’s decision shall be final for the State.

Contractor Initials M
Date/ OEZ 3



8. EVENT OF DEFAULT/REMEDIES.
8.1 Any one or more of the following acts or

omissions of the

Contractor shall constitute an event of default hereunder

(“Event of Default”):

8.1.1 failure to perform the Services satisfactorily or on

schedule;

8.1.2 failure to submit any report required hereunder; and/or
8.1.3 failure to perform any other covenant, term or condition

of this Agreement.

8.2 Upon the occurrence of any Event of Dezru]t, the State

may take any one, or more, or all, of the foll

wing actions:

8.2.1 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event

of Default and requiring it to be remedied wi

thin, in the

absence of a greater or lesser specification of time, thirty (30)

days from the date of the notice; and if the E
not timely remedied, terminate this Agreeme

vent of Default is
nt, effective two

(2) days after giving the Contractor notice of|termination;

8.2.2 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event
of Default and suspending all payments to be made under this
Agreement and ordering that the portion of the contract price
which would otherwise accrue to the Contractor during the
period from the date of such notice until such time as the State

determines that the Contractor has cured the
shall never be paid to the Contractor;

8.2.3 set off against any other obligations the State may owe to

the Contractor any damages the State suffers
Event of Default; and/or

Event of Default

by reason of any

8.2.4 treat the Agreement as breached and pursue any of its

remedies at law or in equity, or both.

9. DATA/ACCESS/CONFIDENTIALITY/

PRESERVATION.

9.1 As used in this Agreement, the word “data” shall mean all

information and things developed or obtaine
performance of, or acquired or developed by
Agreement, including, but not limited to, all
files, formulae, surveys, maps, charts, sound

d during the
reason of, this
studies, reports,
recordings, video

recordings, pictorial reproductions, drawings, analyses,

graphic representations, computer programs,
printouts, notes, letters, memoranda, papers,
all whether finished or unfinished.

9.2 All data and any property which has been
the State or purchased with funds provided f
under this Agreement, shall be the property g
shall be returned to the State upon demand o

termination of this Agreement for any reason.

9.3 Confidentiality of data shall be governed
chapter 91-A or other existing law. Disclosy
requires prior written approval of the State.

computer
and documents,

received from
or that purpose

f the State, and
I upon

by N.H. RSA
re of data

10. TERMINATION. In the event of an early termination of

this Agreement for any reason other than the

completion of the

Services, the Contractor shall deliver to the Contracting
Officer, not later than fifteen (15) days after the date of

termination, a report (“Termination Report”
detail all Services performed, and the contrag
and including the date of termination. The fo

describing in
°t price earned, to
Tm, subject

matter, content, and number of copies of the Termination

Report shall be identical to those of any Final Report
described in the attached EXHIBIT A.

11. CONTRACTOR’S RELATION TO THE STATE. In
the performance of this Agreement the Contractor is in all
respects an independent contractor, and is neither an agent nor
an employee of the State. Neither the Contractor nor any of its
officers, employees, agents or members shall have authority to
bind the State or receive any benefits, workers’ compensation
or other emoluments provided by the State to its employees.

12. ASSIGNMENT/DELEGATION/SUBCONTRACTS.
The Contractor shall not assign, or otherwise transfer any
interest in this Agreement without the prior written consent of
the N.H. Department of Administrative Services. None of the
Services shall be subcontracted by the Contractor without the
prior written consent of the State.

13. INDEMNIFICATION. The Contractor shall defend,
indemnify and hold harmless the State, its officers and
employees, from and against any and all losses suffered by the
State, its officers and employees, and any and all claims,
liabilities or penalties asserted against the State, its officers
and employees, by or on behalf of any person, on account of,
based or resulting from, arising out of (or which may be
claimed to arise out of) the acts or omissions of the
Contractor. Notwithstanding the foregoing, nothing herein
contained shall be deemed to constitute a waiver of the
sovereign immunity of the State, which immunity is hereby
reserved to the State. This covenant in paragraph 13 shall
survive the termination of this Agreement.

14. INSURANCE.

14.1 The Contractor shall, at its sole expense, obtain and
maintain in force, and shall require any subcontractor or
assignee to obtain and maintain in force, the following
insurance:

14.1.1 comprehensive general liability insurance against all
claims of bodily injury, death or property damage, in amounts
of not less than $250,000 per claim and $2,000,000 per
occurrence; and

14.1.2 fire and extended coverage insurance covering all
property subject to subparagraph 9.2 herein, in an amount not
less than 80% of the whole replacement value of the property.
14.2 The policies described in subparagraph 14.1 herein shall
be on policy forms and endorsements approved for use in the
State of New Hampshire by the N.H. Department of
Insurance, and issued by insurers licensed in the State of New
Hampshire.

14.3 The Contractor shall furnish to the Contracting Officer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, a certificate(s)
of insurance for all insurance required under this Agreement.
Contractor shall also furnish to the Contracting Officer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, certificate(s) of
insurance for all renewal(s) of insurance required under this
Agreement no later than fifteen (15) days prior to the
expiration date of each of the insurance policies. The
certificate(s) of insurance and any renewals thereof shall be

Page 3 of 4
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attached and are incorporated herein by reference. Each
certificate(s) of insurance shall contain a clause requiring the
insurer to endeavor to provide the Contracting Officer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, no less than ten

(10) days prior written notice of cancellation
of the policy.

15. WORKERS’ COMPENSATION.

or modification

15.1 By signing this agreement, the Contractpr agrees,

certifies and warrants that the Contractor is i

n compliance with

or exempt from, the requirements of N.H. R§A chapter 281-A

{“Workers’ Compensation”).
15.2 To the extent the Contractor is subject
requirements of N.H. RSA chapter 281-A, C

o the
pntractor shall

maintain, and require any subcontractor or asgsignee to secure
and maintain, payment of Workers’ Comper:fation in

connection with activities which the person

roposes to

undertake pursuant to this Agreement. Contractor shall

furnish the Contracting Officer identified in
or her successor, proof of Workers’ Compen
manner described in N.H. RSA chapter 281-

block 1.9, or his
sation in the
A and any

applicable renewal(s) thereof, which shall be attached and are

incorporated herein by reference. The State

shall not be

responsible for payment of any Workers” Compensation

premiums or for any other claim or benefit f

or Contractor, or

any subcontractor or employee of Contractor, which might

arise under applicable State of New Hampsh
Compensation laws in connection with the p
Services under this Agreement.

16. WAIVER OF BREACH. No failure by

ire Workers’
erformance of the

the State to

enforce any provisions hereof after any Event of Default shall

be deemed a waiver of its rights with regard

to that Event of

Default, or any subsequent Event of Default] No express

failure to enforce any Event of Default shall
waiver of the right of the State to enforce ea

be deemed a
*h and all of the

provisions hereof upon any further or other Event of Default

on the part of the Contractor.

17. NOTICE. Any notice by a party hereto to the other party

shall be deemed to have been duly delivered
time of mailing by certified mail, postage pr
States Post Office addressed to the parties at
given in blocks 1.2 and 1.4, herein.

or given at the
epaid, in a United
the addresses

18. AMENDMENT. This Agreement may be amended,

waived or discharged only by an instrument
by the parties hereto and only after approval
amendment, waiver or discharge by the Gov|
Executive Council of the State of New Ham

in writing signed
of such

ernor and

pshire.

19. CONSTRUCTION OF AGREEMENT AND TERMS.
This Agreement shall be construed in accordance with the

laws of the State of New Hampshire, and is

inures to the benefit of the parties and their 1
successors and assigns. The wording used it
is the wording chosen by the parties to expre

binding upon and
espective

i this Agreement
ss their mutual

Page 4 of 4

intent, and no rule of construction shall be applied against or
in favor of any party.

20. THIRD PARTIES. The parties hereto do not intend to
benefit any third parties and this Agreement shall not be
construed to confer any such benefit.

21. HEADINGS. The headings throughout the Agreement
are for reference purposes only, and the words contained
therein shall in no way be held to explain, modify, amplify or
aid in the interpretation, construction or meaning of the
provisions of this Agreement.

22. SPECIAL PROVISIONS. Additional provisions set
forth in the attached EXHIBIT C are incorporated herein by
reference.

23. SEVERABILITY. In the event any of the provisions of
this Agreement are held by a court of competent jurisdiction to
be contrary to any state or federal law, the remaining
provisions of this Agreement will remain in full force and
effect.

24. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This Agreement, which may
be executed in a number of counterparts, each of which shall
be deemed an original, constitutes the entire Agreement and
understanding between the parties, and supersedes all prior
Agreements and understandings relating hereto.

Contractor Initials /’" f
Date 15223



GENERAL

New Hampshire Employment Securi
for Burglar/Access Alarm Monitorin;
contractor must be certified in monit
proven track record of doing so that ¢

DSC & S2 Systems Monitoring/
Testing & Maintenance will not b
AC Fault/DC Fault Monitoring wi
will include all services.

SERVICES REQUIRED @ NHES

NHES has 15 facilities included in th
the building in early 2014. NHES in
Street, Concord, NH. Services at all si
service list, include two Concord buil
and 298 Hanover Street and 300 Han

SCOPE

Work consists of all labor, tools, equ
Panic/Fire/Burglar/DSC/S2 System a
needed. Contractor is responsible for

travel allowance for services provide
DESCRIPTION OF WORK

A. FIRE/SMOKE ALARM T

Test & Clean  a. Smoke D¢

b. Pull Stati

c. Heat Dete

Contractor will give a list of devices
material. After NHES quotation appn
are acceptable. Testing and cleaning
property that may come under contro
of fire alarm equipment will be repai
every five (5) years. Sensitivity test |

Please note:

1) Inspections are done twice y
2) Smoke Detectors require anr
3) Request for elevator shunts ¢
4) There are 2 elevator hoist wz

NH, 03246; there is a one m
5) Contractor will test all recall
6) There are 21 door holders: 1

Union Ave, Laconia, NH, 03
7 There are no door releasers

EXHIBIT A

ty (NHES) intends to contract for Agency-wide Fire Alarm Testing & Maintenance,
g & Maintenance, and for DSC & S2 Systems Monitoring & Maintenance; winning
bring, maintaining, servicing & supplying parts for these systems and must have a
ran be reviewed. Manufacturer certifications are required with bid.

M:éntenance & Burglar Alarm Maintenance will be for 3 years. Fire Alarm

in until July 1, 2014, and will be included for 2 years; Burglar/Panic/
I not begin until July 1, 2015, and will be included for 1 year. The 3rd year

FACILITIES

s agreement; Tobey Building will be included in this agreement when NHES occupies
ends to relocate three to four buildings to Tobey Building, located @ 45 South Fruit
tes will be ongoing until building is sold. Sites that may be sold and, thus, removed from
dings and two Manchester buildings: 32 South Main Street & 10 West Street in Concord;
over Street, Manchester.

pment, materials and transportation necessary to provide NHES with all phases of
larm testing, monitoring & maintenance, as applicable, at all NHES facilities as
obtaining all materials, permits, and approvals, required for this project. There is no
d.

ESTING & MAINTENANCE:

etectors d. Duct Detectors g. Strobe Horns
Ens e. Elevator Shunts

ctors f. Door Closers/Holders

(pass or fail) in need of repair or replacement along with a quote for labor and
oval, work will be done within 30 days. In emergency situations, faxed quotations
will be done at all NHES locations as listed in Attachment B and any other

| of NHES. Damage to buildings, materials or equipment sustained during testing
red immediately at no expense to NHES. A sensitivity test must be performed

ast performed in 2013.

early.
ual sensitivity tests.
leaning & testing is not simply to ensure power to elevator is shut off.

ys: 1 each @ 32 S Main Street, Concord, NH, 03301, and 426 Union Ave, Laconia,
an lift at 298 Hanover Street, Manchester, NH, 03104.

functions, including primary and secondary car stop locations.

4 (@ 32 S Main Street, Concord; 6 @ 298 Hanover Street, Manchester; and, 1 @ 426
246.

- no electronically locked doors to be released for free egress.

1




pw and/or supervisory devices at each office.

There are remote alarm annunciators at NHES facilities in Claremont, 32 S Main Street, Concord, Conway, 300

Nashua and Somersworth.

There is a radio & digital communications alarm @ 298 Hanover Street facility.

8) There are monitored water {1
9)
Hanover Street, Manchester,
10) There are no signal circuit power boosters.
11)
B.

Contractor will provide statewide sec

BURGLAR/PANIC/AC FAULT/DC FAULT ALARM TESTING, MAINTENANCE & MONITORING:

urity monitoring services for NHES. Service locations include, but are not limited to:

Contractor w

OFFICE TY]
Berlin Pan
Claremont Pan

Concord —10 West
Concord —11 Stickney

Pan
Pan

Concord -32 § Main  Pan
Conway Pan
Keene Pan
Laconia Panic/Burgl
Littleton Pan

Pan
Pan

Manchester, 298- 2
Manchester, 300

Nashua
Portsmouth Pan
Salem Pan

Somersworth - 2 Pan

All sites are

1l conduct weekly communication tests on each connection.

PE

ic/Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/Fire/Water/Daily Test
ic/Burglar/Daily Test
ic/Burglar/Fire/Water/Daily Test

ic /Fire/Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/Water/Gas/Fire/High Temp/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/24 Hr. Water/ Fire
Panic/Fire/Burglar/ AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglat/Fire/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault
ic/Fire/ Burglar/AC Fault/DC Fault

incorporated with Digital Security Controls 4020 System

C.

Contractor will provide all necessary
dealer of listed products with factory|
along with a letter from manufacture

Contractor will supply & install prov
Contractor will include all necessary
in bid.

DSC & S2 MAINTENANCE & MONITORING:

services to maintain NHES DSC & S2 Systems. Contractor must be a certified
trained technicians. Please provide all necessary dealer & training certifications

r stating dealer is in good standing.

en software updates on S2 card access system as needed and approved by NHES.

S2 service support agreements, license fees and any additional software upgrade tees

Attachment C has information regarding DSC, S2, and alarms.

SPECIFICATIONS

Contractor will monitor systems for alarms and faults and will make contact using emergency service unit and employee
call list, provided by NHES. Each employee on call list will be assigned a pass code for identification. Contractor will

call the first person on the list and w

A list with emergency numbers will
each type of monitoring. Emergency

11 continue calling sequentially down the list until a response is received.

be provided to Contractor. Emergency list will define who should be notified for

list is updated periodically and supplied to Contractor and NHES employees.




SAFETY ISSUES and COMPLIANCE REQUIREMENTS

» Safety and protection of NHES personnel and property is of utmost concern. All work will interfere as little as
possible with NHES business. Contractor will at, his own expense wherever necessary or required, furnish safety
devices and take all precautions necessary to protect life and property.

*  Work will be compliant with all ¢xisting state and federal safety laws, rules, regulations and standards including but
not limited to OSHA and U.S. Department of Labor to ensure safety of workers, NHES staff and the general public.

= Damages to NHES property or adjacent property will be the responsibility of Contractor. Contractor will repair all
damages at no cost to NHES.

* Rubbish and debris will be promptly removed from premises as it occurs. All materials will be properly disposed of
off-site in strict accordance with all applicable laws, rules, regulations and ordinances.

Work will be done in a timely and professional manner during normal office working hours. NHES retains the right to
require Contractor to counsel or reassign any employee whose actions or appearance are not consistent with standards of
NHES and in the best interest of those utilizing the service. NHES may, at any time, restrict a Contractor’s employee
from servicing NHES. Such employees will be replaced with a qualified contractor employee meeting NHES acceptance.

EXHIBIT B
INVOICE

Contractor agrees to provide NHES with services indicated in RFP & in Exhibit A of this agreement at prices
quoted in RFP and shown below, in a professional manner, according to specifications.

Labor Rates: M-F, 8§ AM -5 PM $95 Materials Mark-Up 20%
M-F, 5 PM - 8AM $360 minimum charge for 3 hrs, $ 95 per hour thereafter
Saturday $360 minimum charge for 3 hrs, $ 95 per hour thereafter
Sunday $420 minimum charge for 3 hrs, $120 per hour thereafter
Holiday $420 minimum charge for 3 hrs, $120 per hour thereafter
S2 Software Updates, Service Support Agreements, & License Fees for life of contract: $12,000
Contract not to exceed: $95,668
COST BREAKDOWN: CONTRACT RUNS DECEMBER - NOVEMBER, 36 MONTHS
YEAR1 YEAR 2 YEAR 3
Testing/Inspection $ 9,020 $20,920 $23,728
Updates, Support, Licenses $12,000 $ 0 $ 0
Repair Budget $10.000 $10,000 $10,000
$31,020 $30,920 $33,728
FY14 = $23,095 FY15 = $25,961.65 FY16 = $32,558 FY17 = $14,053.35 TOTAL: $95,668.00

Contractor will invoice NHES for Annual maintenance fees & for Updates, Service Support & License fees following G&C
Approval. Contractor will invoice for|repair costs following completion and acceptance of each job. NHES will make payment
through normal state payment process, which is up to 30 days following receipt of approved invoice.

Invoice must include the following:

1. Date work was done & location of job site
2. Brief Description of service
3. Hourly rate charged [and extensions
Invoices will be sent to: Helen A. Dinsmore

NH Employment Security
32 South Main St
Concord NH 03301-4857




TERM & EXTENSION
Agreement term begins 12/01/13, or

TERMINATION

EXHIBIT C

upon Governor and Council approval, whichever is later, and terminates 11/30/16.

If Contractor fails to perform services as required, this agreement will without notice, become void and of no effect, with
no liability on the part of NHES beyand the date on which Contractor fails to perform required services. Either party may

terminate this agreement at any time.
certified mail, to so terminate at least

The party requesting termination must give the other party written notice, by
thirty (30) days prior to effective date of termination.

CONFIDENTIALITY, CRIMINAL RECORD & NH CERTIFICATE OF GOOD STANDING
Contractor and his employees will be required to sign and submit a STATEMENT OF CONFIDENTIALITY OF

RECORDS FORM (DES 1726), an
applicable, prior to any work being d

any personnel scheduled to enter NH

d a CRIMINAL RECORDS FORM (DES 2135), to be provided by NHES, if
pne. There is a $25 fee for each check required. During the course of this agreement
ES must be reported to a NHES official and a STATEMENT OF

CONFIDENTIALITY OF RECORDS FORM and a CRIMINAL RECORDS FORM submitted for processing prior

to entrance to NHES. Contractor m

t provide a Certificate of Good Standing from NH Secretary of State. A $5 fee is

u
required for Certificate of Good Stjnding.

DAMAGE

Contractor will agree that any damage to building(s), materials, equipment or other property during performance of

service will be repaired at his expens

original or better condition and accep

representative assigned to project for

SUB-CONTRACTING

Contractor will not assign, subcontra
agreement without prior consent of N
approval.

e. Contractor agrees to return all buildings, materials, equipment or property to its
tance by a representative of NHES. Contractor agrees to obtain approval of NHES
any sub-contractor performing such repair work.

ct or otherwise transfer any duty obligation, or written performance required by this
JHES. All subcontractors must be listed on the bid page of this document for pre-

ACCEPTANCE OR REJECTION BY NH EMPLOYMENT SECURITY

NHES reserves the right to accept or

reject any or all proposals submitted for consideration. All proposals will be kept

sealed and safe until the date, time and place of public opening.

CERTIFICATION REGARDING
MATTERS PRIMARY COVERE

DEBARMENT, SUSUPENSION AND OTHER RESPONSIBILITY
D TRANSACTIONS

Contractor certifies that the primary |
presently debarred, suspended, propa
transactions by any Federal departme
this statement.

DAVIS-BACON ACT

Davis-Bacon Act and Related Acts, 4
contracts in excess of $2,000 for con
or public works. Under these Acts ca
fringe benefits for corresponding wo
is no Davis Bacon assignation. Appli
excluding power equipment rate. Pre

participant, and its principals, to the best of its knowledge and belief, are not
sed for debarment, declared ineligible or voluntarily excluded from covered
nt or agency. Contractor will inform NHES of any changes in the status regarding

ipply to contractors and subcontractors performing on federally funded/assisted
struction, alteration, or repair (including painting and decorating) of public buildings
ntractors and subcontractors must pay laborers and mechanics prevailing wages and
rk on similar projects in the area, as determined by Department of Labor. When there
cable Wage Determination is realized by using the lowest skilled craft above laborer,
vailing Wages for this project are listed in Attachment B.




AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT

The undersigned agrees to comply with all Federal, State and Local ADA rules and regulations.

PAYMENT BOND/MILLER ACT

Contractor agrees to comply with The Miller Act bond requirement and NHRS 447:16. A Payment Bond, with a surety
satisfactory for protection of all persons supplying labor and material in carrying out work provided for in the contract.

Amount of payment bond will equal

total amount payable by terms of contract unless officer awarding contract

determines, in a writing supported by specific finds, that a payment bond in that amount is impractical, in which case
contracting officer will set amount of payment bond. Amount of bond will not be less than total amount of contract. A
payment bond is required for contracts of $35,000 — 99,999 Dollars. A Performance Bond is required for contracts

totaling $100,000 Dollars or more.




ATTACHMENT A
1

NHES Berlin Office @ 151 Pleasant St., Berlin, NH, 03570

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and
Models

Printer

Software

Other

Ty

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or
does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup
communication?




ATTACHMENT A
2

NHES Claremont Office @ 404 Washington St., Claremont, NH, 03743

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Models

Printer

Software

Other

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup

communication?




ATTACHMENT A

3

NHES Administrative Building @ 32 S. Main St., Concord, NH, 03301

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Models

Printer

Software

Other

|I"wu'

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarn

-

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar

Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Mod

el #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have b
communication?

)ackup

l l | ﬂlllllll
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ATTACHMENT A
4

NHES Concord Office @ 10 West St., Concord, NH, 03302

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Madel

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Models

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Printer

Software

Other

' l

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

-

Low/High Temperature Alarn

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar|/Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

communication?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup

I




ATTACHMENT A

5

NHES Stickney Ave Warehouse @ 11 Stickney Ave., Concord, NH, 03301

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make an

d Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity an

d Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Mak
Models

e and

Printer

Software

Other

Alarm Moni

toring & Maintenance Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

.Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar,

Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup

communication?

I l ‘ Illlllll
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ATTACHMENT A
6

NHES Conway Office @ 518 White Mountain Hwy,. Conway, NH, 03818

Burglar AIArm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Models

Printer

Software

Other

i |l|
;

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup —

communication?

11




ATTACHMENT A

7

NHES Keene Office @ 109 Key Rd., Keene, NH, 03431

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Madel

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Siz

es

Power Supply — Quantity anP Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Models

Printer

Software

Other

T

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

I
N

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm

)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar

Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have t
communication?

packup

il ll
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ATTACHMENT A

8

NHES Laconia Office @ 426 Union Ave., Laconia, NH, 03246

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equjpment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and
Models

Printer

Software

Other

||'| lll'l'

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

I AL
|

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or
does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup
communication?

13




ATTACHMENT A

9

NHES Littleton Office @ 646 Union St., Suite 100, Littleton, NH, 03561

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and
Models

Printer

Software

Other

1l

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or
does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup
communication?

T

14




ATTACHMENT A

10

NHES Appeals Office @ 298 Hanover St., Manchester, NH, 03104

Burglar AIer/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Siz

es

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Models

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Printer

Software

Other

i

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarn

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm

)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar

Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Mod

el #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup

communication?

’I l |
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ATTACHMENT A

11

NHES Manchester Office @ 300 Hanover St., Manchester, NH, 03104

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and
Models

Printer

Software

Other

.
N

R ——
IS ——

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

'““ u

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or
does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup
communication?

16



ATTACHMENT A
12

NHES Nashua Office @ 6 Townsend West, Nashua, NH, 03063

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Models

Printer

Software

Other

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarn

=

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm

)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar

Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

’ LU

Does Fire Alarm panel have &
communication?

yackup
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ATTACHMENT A

13

NHES Portsmouth Office @ 2000 Lafayette Rd., Portsmouth, NH, 03801

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Models

Printer

Software

Other

iyt

Alarm Monitoring Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup

communication?

3
[

' l I lllll i
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ATTACHMENT A
14

NHES Salem|Office @ 29 S Broadway, Salem, NH, 03079

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance

Manufacturer/Brand of Equipment

Control Panel Make and Model

Peripheral Devices Make and Model

Control Pads Make and Model

Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Models

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and

Printer

Software

Other

il

Alarm Monitoring & Maintenance Services Required

Burglar Alarm

Fire Alarm

Boiler Alarm

Generator Alarm

Low/High Temperature Alarm

Panic/Duress Alarm

Other (Indicate type of Alarm)

Are Alarms Tied Into Burglar Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or

does it have it's own
communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup

communication?

il
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ATTACHMENT A
15

NHES Somersworth Office @ 6 Marsh Brook Dr., Somersworth, NH, 03878

Burglar Alarm/Access Control System Maintenance
Manufacturer/Brand of Equjpment
Control Panel Make and Model
Peripheral Devices Make and Model
Control Pads Make and Model
Batteries — Quantity and Sizes

Power Supply — Quantity and Sizes

Key Pads/Controllers — Make and
Models
Printer
Software
Other

iy

Alarm Monitoring & Maintenance Services Required

Burglar Alarm
Fire Alarm
Boiler Alarm
Generator Alarm
Low/High Temperature Alarm
Panic/Duress Alarm
Other (Indicate type of Alarm)
Are Alarms Tied Into BurglanF Alarm?

Fire Alarm Panel Type & Model #

Is Fire Alarm tied to Burglar Alarm or
does it have communicator/dialer?

Does Fire Alarm panel have backup
communication?

ml ! |
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ATTACHMENT B

NEW HAMPSHIRE EMPLOYMENT SECURITY

For scheduling please contact Jesse Propri: (O) 228-4127; (C) 603-419-9757; Jesse.B.Propri@nhes.nh.gov

NHES OFFICE SQ FEET CONTACT PERSON TELEPHONE
151 Pleasant St. 5,312 Mark Belanger, Mgr. (603) 752-5500
Berlin NH 03570-0159

17 Water Street 5,300 Vickie Herrick, Mgr., (603) 543-3111
Claremont NH 03743-2261

32 S Main Street 21,902 Jesse Propri, Mt. Mgr. (603) 228-4027
4003Concord NH 03301-4857 Ernie Liakas

10 West St 25,000 Jesse Propri, Mt. Mgr. (603) 228-4027
Concord NH 03301-1140 Carol Cantin

518 White Mountain Highway 5,307 Kathy Howard, Mgr. (603) 447-5924
Conway NH 03818

109 Key Road 4,800 Vickie Herrick (603) 352-1904
Keene NH 03431

426 Union Ave. Ste 3 9,560 Carol Cantin, Mgr. (603) 524-3960
Laconia NH 03246-2894

646 Union Street, Suite 100 6,510 Kathy Howard (603) 444-2971
Littleton NH 03561

300 Hanover St 20,000 J. Dubois, Mtn. (603) 656-6602
Manchester NH 03104-4957 Leanne Topolosky

298 Hanover St. 10,000 J.Dubois, Mtn. (603) 656-6602
Manchester NH 03104 Leanne Topolosky

6 Townsend West 12,000 Mike Walden, Mgr. (603) 882-5177
Nashua NH 03060-3285

2000 Lafayette Rd 7,500 Arlene Murphy, Mgr. (603) 436-3702
Portsmouth NH 03801-5673

29 S Broadway 5,504 Mike Walden, Mgr. (603) 893-9185
Salem NH 03079-3026

6 Marsh Brook Drive 10,000 Arlene Murphy, Mgr. (603) 742-3600

Somersworth, NH 03878-3878
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State of Netwr Hampshive

CERTIFICATE

I, William M. Gardner, Secretary of State of the State of New Hampshire, do hereby

certify that East Coast Security Services, Inc. is a New Hampshire corporation duly

incorporated under the laws of the State of New Hampshire on May 18, 1990. I further

certify that all fees and annual reports required by the Secretary of State's office have been

received and that articles of dissolution have not been filed.

In TESTIMONY WHEREOF, I hereto

set my hand and cause to be affixed

the Seal of the State of New Hampshire,
this 22*  day of May, A.D. 2013

Zy Skl

William M. Gardner
Secretary of State



CERTIFICATE OF VOTE
EAST /COAST SECURITY SERVICES, INC.

Name of Authorizing Person — Not the person signing the contract

§
b

&

ot To ot Cotypidbuts |
e

P el re

Title

East Coast Security Services, Inc. hereby authorizes

2z //Z%
MMH—V——’ —/ ’
Tin ame o € n DEINg uthonzed — Person 51gnmg contract S(gn ure

to execute, submit, deliver, and amend on behalf

%/}5 7

itle

of East Coast Security Services, Inc. any and all documents or contracts in connection with NH
Employment Security Alarm/DSC/S2 Maintenance/Inspection/Service agreement.

Intended effective dates: &Y —C' A013

Acknowledgement: State of _/ V//

Aét/ f,/o'u/ 3 , before the U1W officer, personally appeared
_— and

identified as 6 d J

and

through November 30, 2016.

, County of ﬁ([/MW on

/Ow//)ﬂz'

Title of Autborizing Person

40 b

or satisfactop

uthornzing Person

ﬁon whose name is signed as

—

Title of Person being Authorized

above, and acknowledged that she/he/they executed this document in the capacity indicated.

/\

s : Jpyp—
1/ L /)ﬁ Lt clee B

iy,

" Signature of Kotary Public/Justice of Peace

%
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Name & Title of Notary Public/Justicé of Peace Commission Expires




A ﬁ CERTIFICLTE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE 10/11/2013.

CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR| NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DPOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S), AUTHORIZED

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER, AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder Is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policy(ies) must be endorsed. |f SUBROGATION {S WAIVED, subject to
the terms and conditions of the policy, certain palicies may require an endorsement. A statement on this certificate does not confer rights to the
certificate holder in lisu of such endorsement(s}.

PRODUCER CONTACT patricia Capadanno
Tonry Northwest Insurance Agency, Inc. FHoNe i (781)861-1800 1 EA% ngi; 701 v61-100¢
238 Bedford Street ﬂ_‘ﬁ'mpcapud&nno@tonrynv. com
. INSURER(S) AFFORDING COVERAGE : NAIC#

Lexington MA 02420 iNsurer A Philadelphia Indemnity 18058
INSURED msurera Nethexlands Insurance Company 24171
Bagt Coast Security Services | nsurerc Philadelphia Insurance
68 8tiles Road msurerpA.I.M. Mutual Insurance Co.

msurer @ :Peerless Insurance Company 4198
Balem NH 03079 INSURER F :
COVERAGES CERTIFICA@UMBER:CLIBJ.M 07284 REVISION NUMBER:

THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED.. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT. TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECT TO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS,
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS,

l:Ol.l EFF | POLICY EXP LMITS

L TYPE OF INSURANCE L{MMDDYYYYV) .
f_ENERALLMBMrY | EACH OCCURRENCE $ 1,000,000
X | COMMERCIAL GENERAL LIABILITY s 100,000
A | cLamsmace [ X | oceur PHPK1052209 [8/22/2013 8/21/2014 [ ygp exp pay onaporson) |3 10,000
: T PERSONAL & ADVINAURY _|$ 1,000,000
E B&O ' _ GENERAL AGGREGATE __ | § 2,000,000
GENL AGGREGATE LMIT APPLIES PER: PRODUCTS - COMP/IOP AGG | 8 2,000,000
'] poucy [ 158% Loc $
\_A‘T"WWL!W'"" e TNGE W™ 7009, 000
B ANY AUTO ‘ . _ BODILY INJURY (Per person) | $
ALLOWNED || SCHEDULED BA1070447 9/7/2013 )9/7/2014 BODILY INJURY (Per socdent)| §
o el o el St R
$
| X [ussRELLALAR | | oceuR ‘ | EACH OCCURRENCE s 4,000,000
¢ EXCESS LAR CLAIMS-MADE L AGGREGATE $ 4,000,000
D NS 429121 /21/2013 [8/21/2014 s
¢ PROP! : E.L: EACH ACCIDENT s 500,000
T%:mwm El] A Becsooa000073 f0/13/3013 F°/1”2°1‘ E.L. DISEASE - £A EMPLOYEH § '5og:zgo
, oé@m;mou OF OPERATIONS below EL DISEASE - POLICY LMIT | § 500,000
E |Leased & or Rented CBPLOT0448 .0/13/2013[10/13/2014/( 40,000
squipment

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS / LOCATIONS / VEHICLES (Attach ACORD 101, Additional Remaris Schedule, if mors space Is required)

]

CERTIFICATE HOLDER CANCELLATION

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POUCIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS,

New Hampshire Employment Security

32 South Main Street

Contord, NH 03301 AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE
L Tonry Jr./KATEPR 5/’4“ < L 4 -
ACORD:25 (2010/05) © 1988-2010 ACORD CORPORATION. All rights reserved.

INS025 20100 a1 Tha ACORD nama and lnan ara ranietarad marke af ACORD

[ ———




NH Employment Security ALARM/DSC/S2 TESTING/MAINTENANCE/MONITORING PROJECT

Bid Opening 9/13/13 2:00PM

17 RFPs Distributed: 5 Newspaper, 0 internet, 12 NHES Database Responses, 1 Bid Submitted

Vendor Vendor Addresss Is Company Certified?
Bid Ascertained Via Bid Reason for not bidding
A2 Systems 15 New England Executive Park, Burlington, MA, 01803 NO BID Company working on certification
Matt Leonard Mleonard@A2Systems.com Company got certifications for Pronto Series not Netbox
NHES Database 855-438-7101 Series, which is what NHES requires. NOT CERTIFIED.
[BCM 30 Commerce Way, Woburn, MA, 01801 NO BID Company is certified
Henry Francillon francillonh@bcmeontrols.com No time/cannot bid competitively
NHES Database 781-933-8878
Capitol Alarm 37 Washington Street, Penacook, NH, 03303 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Bob Phelps bob@capitolalarms.com
NHES Database 63-753-4044
East Coast Security Systems 68 Stiles Road, Ste C, Salem, NH, 03079 Company is certified
Mark DuFour, Jr. markdjr@ecss.com $65,668 + T&M
NHES Database 603-898-6823
Griffon Security 254 River Street, Springvale, ME, 04083 NO BID Company is certified
Timothy Barrett timbarrett@agriffonsecurity.com No time/cannot bid competitively
NHES Database 207-512-5658
Interstate Electrical Services 15 Cote Lane, Bedford, NH, 03110 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Tracy Young tyoung@iesci1.com
Newspaper 603-296-2401
Interstate Fire Protection PO Box 1005, North Conway, NH, 03860 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Peter Tweedie ptweedie@interstaefire.com
NHES Database 800-717-6454
JDSCC 4 Industrial Park Drive Unit 33, Pelham, NH, 03076 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Ben Slattery bslattery@idscc.com
Newspaper 603-635-1613
Norris, Inc. 2257 West Broadway, S Portland, ME, 04106 NO BID Company is certified
Dave Gagnon daveg@norrisinc.com Scope of project is not a good fit for company.
NHES Database 800-370-3473
Pelmac Industries 12 Commercial Court, Auburn, NH, 03032 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Dan Boyce Dboyce@Peimac.com
NHES Database 603-623-5916

Ads: Union Leader; NH-PTAP, Construction Summary, Onvia, MyBid, Reed Business, IsQft, McGraw-Hill, Works In Progress,etc.
NHES Database: Bidders previously responding to similar NHES projects advertised in Newspaper or on Internet.




NH Employment Security ALARM/DSC/S2 TESTING/MAINTENANCE/MONITORING PROJECT

Bid Opening 9/13/13 2:00PM

17 RFPs Distributed: 5 Newspaper, 0 Internet, 12 NHES Database Responses, 1 Bid Submitted

Vendor Vendor Addresss Is Company Certified?
Bid Ascertained Via Bid Reason for not bidding
Seacoast Security 280 Heritage Ave, Ste C, Portsmouth, NH, 03801 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Brian Cormier brianc@seacoastsecurity.com
Newspaper 800-654-8800
Securadyne Systems (SURV) 600 Research Drive, Wilmington, MA, 01887 NO BID Company is certified

Justin Davis
NHES Database

Justin.Davis@securadyne.com
978-253-5021

Scope of project is not a good fit for company.

SIGNET Electronic Systems, Inc.
Dan Chauvin
NHES Database

106 Longwater Drive, Norwell, MA, 02061
Daniel.Chauvin@signetgroup.net
781-871-5888

NO BID Company is certified
Scope of project is not a good fit for company.

Total Security 135 Weirs Boulevard, Unit C-1, Laconia, NH, 03246 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Ralph King rking@totalsecuritynh.com
NHES Database 603-524-2833
Tri-State Fire Protection, LLC 84 lake Street, Nashua, NH, 03060 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Dick Baynes Richard@getffireprotection.com
Newspaper 603-293-7531
Tyco 18 Clinton Drive, Hollis, NH, 03049 NO BID Company is not S2 Certified
Jeff McGrath jmegrath@tyco.com
Newspaper 603-801-8726
Viscom Systems, Inc. 98 Galen Street, Watertown, MA, 03049 NO BID Company is certified
Matt Cunningham mcunningham@viscomsystems.com Scope of project is not a good fit for company.
NHES Database 617-864-3676

Ads: Union Leader; NH-PTAP, Construction Summary, Onvia, MyBid, Reed Business, IsQft, McGraw-Hill, Works In Progress,etc.
NHES Database: Bidders previously responding to similar NHES projects advertised in Newspaper or on Internet.




