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Charles M. Arlinghaiis
Commissioner
(603) 271-3201

State of New Hampshire
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

25 Cnpitol Street - Room 100
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

0(Tice@das. nli.gov

Catherine A. Kcnne
Deputy Commissioner

(603) 271-2059

Sheri L. Rockburn
Assistant Commissioner

(603) 271-3204

August 2, 2022

His Excellency, Governor Christopher T. Sununu
and the Honorable Council

Slate House
Concord, New Hampshire 03301

REQUESTED ACTION

Authorize the Department of Administrative Services to enter into a statewide contract
with Gemini Electric Inc. dba Power Up Generator Service Co. (VC# 156871) of 8 Priscilla
Lane, Auburn NH, 03032, in an amount up to and not to exceed $300,000.00 for Generator
Maintenance and Repair. The term shall be effective upon Governor and Executive Council
Approval through August 31, 2025 with the option to extend for two (2) additional one-year
extension terms.

Funding shall be provided through individual agency expenditures, none of which shall
be permitted unless there are sufficient appropriated funds to cover the expenditure.

EXPLANATION

The Department of Administrative Services, through the Bureau of Purchase and
Property, issued Request for Bid 2633-23 on June 21, 2022 with responses due on July 7, 2022.
There were six (6) compliant responses received with Gemini Electric Inc. dba Power Up
Generator Service Co. submitting the lowest compliant pricing for four (4) counties.

The purpose of this item is to obtain approval to enter into contract for preventative
maintenance, load testing, and repairs supporting the State's fleet of backup power generators.
Notable changes from the previous contract resulting from RFB 2189-19 are as follows; twenty-
eight (28) new generators have been added to the following counties: Rockingham County,
sixteen (16), Merrimack County, ten (10), Hillsborough County, one (1), and Carroll County,
one (1); Belknap County reduced generator inventory by one (1) generator from the prior
contract period.
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The four (4) counties awarded to Gemini Electric Inc. dba Power Up Generator Service
Co. represent a total cost of $150,315.00 for preventive maintenance and load bank testing for
the three (3) year contract term. The Division of Procurement & Support Services has performed
an analysis against the historical usage for repair services over the expiring contract terni and
included an allowance of $149,685.00 to accommodate agency needs in the coming three (3)
years. The suggested price limitation of $300,000.00 represents an increase from prior contract
of approximately 24% comparing existing locations. This increase in cost is primarily due to the
continued instability of the supply chain i.e. increases in fuel, material cost, limited labor, etc. It
should be noted that the next low compliant bid was approximately 14% higher than Gemini
Electric Inc. dba Power Up Generator Service Co.

financiol Data;

Repair Forecast 2022-2025

PM/Load Test

2022-2025

Repair Actual
2039-2022

Repair
Projection
2022-2025

Total

Contract

2022-2025

Power Up $150,315.00 $157,186.95 $149,685.00 $300,000.00

Based on the foregoing, I am respectfully recommending approval of the contract with
Gemini Electric Inc. dba Power Up Generator Ser\'ice Co.

Respectfully submitted,

7/

Charles M. Arlinghaus
Commissioner
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Division of Procurement Support Services

Bureau of Purchase Property

Gary S. Lunetta
Director

(603) 271-2210

Bid Description
GENERATOR

MAINTENANCE

BidH 2633-23

Afeni Name Jeff Haley

TOTAL PRICE PER COUffTY

Calculated as Total Major and Mlnon PM's (Contract Term 2022-2025) * Total Annual Load Bank Testing of all DIesei/Keorsene Gerwrators (Contract Term 2022-2025)

SEC A TOTAL SEC B TOTAL 5EC C TOTAL SEC D TOTAL SEC E TOTAL SECFTOTAl SEC G TOTAL SEC H TOTAL SEC i TOTAL SEC J TOTAL

Beiknap Carroli Cheshire Coos Gratton Hillsborough Merrimack Rockingham Strafiord Sullivan

Brookfield $49,342.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 573,554.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 57,628.00
Cummins •  $54,799.17 $36,696.7$ 522,069.98 589,613.39 599,895.56 5132,160.44 5358,293.42 5118,730.01 559,946.90 59,636.48
Powers No Bid No Bid 521.285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 58,940.00
Timberline $93,784.50 $55,566.00 $36,667.35 5101,573.55 $146,389.50 5202,849.20 5610,558.13 5226,979.10 5109,573.20 515,429.15

TriState $29,190.00 517,095.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid . 559,805.00 5167,490.00 $45,699.00 525,350.00 No Bid

Power Up $32,949.00 522,431.00 $13,254.00 565,367.00 566,444.00 579,320.00 5247,737.00 579,164.00 534,686.00 55,250.00

Cost Comparison to Explrlni Contract

Total of Sections
Assumed

Contract 5per>d

Prior Contract

Award

Actual Spend

2019-2022
Total OiffererKe

X Difference

Actual

% Difference

Forcasted
% irtcrease

TriState $344,619.00 $603,033.25 5136,192.00 $417,116.12 5280,924.12 206.27% 175.00% 30.84%

Power Up $150,315.00 5300,630.00 $72,300.00 $229,486.95 5157,186.95 217.41% 200.00% 23.66%

Total Cost Avoldartce as Compared to Next low Bid

Beiknap Carroil Cheshire Coos Graft on Hillsborough Merrimack Rockingham Strafford Sullivan Total

%Cosl

Avoidance

TriState $3,759.00 $5,346.00 519,515.00 580,247.00 533,465.00 59,336.00 5151,668.00 25.15%

Power up 58,031.00 524,246.39 57,110.00 541,765.39 13.89%

Repair Forecast 2022-2025 Grand loial 5193.433.39
PM/Load Test

2022-2025

Repair Actual

2019-2022

Repair Forecast

2022-2025

Total Contract

2022-2025

TriState $344,619.00 S2aO.S24.12 5255,381.00 $600,000.00

Power Up $150,315.00 5157,186.95 5149,685.00 5300,000.00



FORM NUMBER P-37 (version 12/11/2019)

Notice: This agreement and all of its attachments shall become public upon submission to Governor and
Executive Council for approval. Any information that is private, confidential or proprietary must
be clearly identified to the agency and agreed to in writing prior to signing the contract.

AGREEMENT

The State of New Hampshire and the Contractor hereby mutually agree as follows:

GENERAL PROVISIONS

1. IDENTIFICATION.

I.I State Agency Name

Department of Administrative Services
Bureau of Purchase and Property

1.2 State Agency Address

25 Capitol Street, Room 102
Concord, NH 03301

1.3 Contractor Name

Gemini Electric Inc, dba Power Up Generator Service Co.
VC# 156871

1.4 Contractor Address

8 Priscilla Lane

Auburn NH, 03032

1.5 Contractor Phone

Number

603-657-9080

1.6 Account Number

Various

1.7 Completion Date

August 31, 2025

1.8 Price Limitation

$300,000.00

1.9 Contracting Officer for State Agency

Jeff Haley

I.IO State Agency Telephone Number

603-271-2201

1.11 Contractor Signature

8/3/22

1.12 Name and Title of Contractor Signatory

Matthew C Connors, President

1.13 State Agency Signature

—-S" Date:
1.14 Name and Title of State Agency Signatory

Charles M. Arlinghaus, Commissioner

1.15 Approval by the N.H. Department of Administration, Division of Personnel (ifapplicable)

By: Director, On:

1.16 Approval by the Attorney General (Form, Substance and Execution) (ifapplicable)

ToMyyuka- O"' 8/3/2022

1.17 Approval by the Governor and Executive Council (if applicable)

G&C Item number: G&C Meeting Date:
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2. SERVICES TO BE PERFORMED. The State of New
Hampshire, acting through the agency identified in block I.I

("Stale"), engages contractor identified in block 1.3
("Contractor") to perform, and the Contractor shall perform, the
work or sale of goods, or both, identified and more particularly
described in the attached EXHIBIT B which is incorporated
herein by reference ("Services").

3. EFFECTIVE DATE/COMPLETION OF SERVICES.

3.1 Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the
contrary, and subject to the approval of the Governor and
Executive Council of the Slate of New Hampshire, if applicable,
this Agreement, and all obligations of the parties hereunder, shall
become effective on the date the Governor, and Executive

Council approve this Agreement as indicated in block 1.17,
unless no such approval is required, in which case the Agreement
shall become effective on the date the Agreement is signed by
the State Agency as shown in block 1.13 ("Effective Date").
3.2 If the Contractor commences the Services prior to the
EfTective Date, all Services performed by the Contractor prior to
the EfTective Date shall be performed at the sole risk of the
Contractor, and in the event that this Agreement does not become
effective, the State shall have no liability to the Contractor,
including without limitation, any obligation to pay the
Contractor for any costs incurred or Services performed.
Contractor must complete ail Services by the Completion Date
specified in block 1.7.

4. CONDITIONAL NATURE OF AGREEMENT.

Notwithstanding any provision of this Agreement to the
contrary, all obligations of the Stale hereunder, including,
without limitation, the continuance of payments hereunder, are
contingent upon the availability and continued appropriation of
funds affected by any state or federal legislative or executive
action that reduces, eliminates or otherwise modifies the
appropriation or availability of funding for this Agreement and
the Scope for Services provided in EXHIBIT B, in whole or in
part. In no event shall the State be liable for any payments
hereunder in excess of such available appropriated funds. In the
event of a reduction or termination of appropriated funds, the
Slate shall have the right to withhold payment until such funds
become available, if ever, and shall have the right to reduce or
terminate the Services under this Agreement immediately upon
giving the Contractor notice of such reduction or termination.
The Slate shall not be required to transfer funds from any other
account or source to the Account identified in block 1.6 in the

event funds in that Account are reduced or unavailable.

5. CONTRACT PRICE/PRICE LIMITATION/

PAYMENT.

5.1 The contract price, method of payment, and terms of payment
are identified and more particularly described in EXHIBIT C
which is incorporated herein by reference.
5.2 The payment by the State of the contract price shall be the
only and the complete reimbursement to the Contractor for all
expenses, of whatever nature incurred by the Contractor in the
performance hereof, and shall be the only and the complete

compensation to the Contractor for the Services. The State shall
have no liability to the Contractor other than the contract price.
5.3 The State reserves the right to olTset from any amounts
otherwise payable to the Contractor under this Agreement those
liquidated amounts required or permitted by N.H. RSA 80:7
through RSA 80:7-c or any other provision of law.
5.4 Notwithstanding any provision in this Agreement to the
contrary, and notwithstanding unexpected circumstances, in no
event shall the total of all payments authorized, or actually made
hereunder, exceed the Price Limitation set forth in block 1.8.

6. COMPLIANCE BY CONTRACTOR WITH LAWS

AND REGULATIONS/ EQUAL EMPLOYMENT
OPPORTUNITY.

6.1 In connection with the performance of the Services, the
Contractor shall comply with all applicable statutes, laws,
regulations, and orders of federal, stale, county or municipal
authorities which impose any obligation or duty upon the
Contractor, including, but not limited to, civil rights and equal
employment opportunity laws. In addition, if this Agreement is
funded in any part by monies of the United Slates, the Contractor
shall comply with all federal executive orders, rules, regulations
and statutes, and with any rules, regulations and guidelines as the
State or the United Slates issue to implement these regulations.
The Contractor shall also comply with all applicable intellectual
property laws.
6.2 During the term of this Agreement, the Contractor shall not
discriminate against employees or applicants for employment
because of race, color, religion, creed, age, sex, handicap, sexual
orientation, or national origin and will take affirmative action to
prevent such discrimination.
6.3. The Contractor agrees to permit the State or United States
access to any of the Contractor's books, records and accounts for
the purpose of ascertaining compliance with all rules, regulations
and orders, and the covenants, terms and conditions of this
Agreement.

7. PERSONNEL.

7.1 The Contractor shall at its own expense provide all personnel
necessary to perform the Services. The Contractor warrants that
all personnel engaged in the Services shall be qualified to
perform the Services, and shall be properly licensed and
otherwise authorized to do so under all applicable laws.
7.2 Unless otherwise authorized in writing, during the term of
this Agreement, and for a period of six (6) months after the
Completion Date in block 1.7, the Contractor shall not hire, and
shall not permit any subcontractor or other person, firm or
corporation with whom it is engaged in a combined effort to
perform the Services to hire, any person who is a State employee
or official, who is materially involved in the procurement,
administration or performance of this Agreement. This
provision shall survive termination of this Agreement.
7.3 The Contracting Officer specified in block 1.9, or his or her
successor, shall be the State's representative. In the event of any
dispute concerning the interpretation of this Agreement, the
Contracting OfTcer's decision shall be final for the State.
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8. EVENT OF DEFAULT/REMEDIES.

8.1 Any one or more of the following acts or omissions of the
Contractor shall constitute an event of default hereunder ("Event

of Default"):
8.1.1 failure to perform the Services satisfactorily or on
schedule;

8.1.2 failure to submit any report required hereunder; and/or
8.1.3 failure to perform any other covenant, term or condition of
this Agreement.
8.2 Upon the occurrence of any Event of Default, the State may
take any one, or more, or all, of the following actions:
8.2.1 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event of
Default and requiring it to be remedied within, in the absence of
a greater or lesser specification of time, thirty (30) days from the
date of the notice; and if the Event of Default is not timely cured,
terminate this Agreement, effective two (2) days after giving the
Contractor notice of termination;
8.2.2 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event of
Default and suspending all payments to be made under this
Agreement and ordering that the portion of the contract price
which would otherwise accrue to the Contractor during the
period from the date of such notice until such time as the State
determines that the Contractor has cured the Event of Default

shall never be paid to the Contractor;
8.2.3 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event of
Default and set off against any other obligations the State may
owe to the Contractor any damages the State suffers by reason of
any Event of Default; and/or
8.2.4 give the Contractor a written notice specifying the Event of
Default, treat the Agreement as breached, terminate the
Agreement and pursue any of its remedies at law or in equity, or
both.

8.3. No failure by the State to enforce any provisions hereof after
any Event of Default shall be deemed a waiver of its rights with
regard to that Event of Default, or any subsequent Event of
Default. No express failure to enforce any Event of Default shall
be deemed a waiver of the right of the State to enforce each and
all of the provisions hereof upon any further or other Event of
Default on the part of the Contractor.

9. TERMINATION.

9.1 Notwithstanding paragraph 8, the State may, at its sole
discretion, terminate the Agreement for any reason, in whole or
in part, by thirty (30) days written notice to the Contractor that
the State is exercising its option to terminate the Agreement.
9.2 In the event of an early termination of this Agreement for
any reason other than the completion of the Services, the
Contractor shall, at the State's discretion, deliver to the
Contracting Officer, not later than fifteen (15) days after the date
of termination, a report ("Termination Report") describing in
detail all Services performed, and {he contract price earned, to
and including the date of termination. The form, subject matter,
content, and number of copies of the Termination Report shall
be identical to those of any Final Report described in the attached
EXHIBIT B. In addition, at the State's discretion, the Contractor
shall, within 15 days of notice of early termination, develop and
submit to the State a Transition Plan for services under the

Agreement.

Page 3

10. DATA/ACCESS/CONFIDENT]ALITV/

PRESERVATION.

10.1 As used in this Agreement, the word "data" shall mean all
information and things developed or obtained during the
performance of, or acquired or developed by reason of, this
Agreement, including, but not limited to, all studies, reports,
files, formulae, surveys, maps, charts, sound recordings, video
recordings, pictorial reproductions, drawings, analyses, graphic
representations, computer programs, computer printouts, notes,
letters, memoranda, papers, and documents, all whether
finished or unfinished.

10.2 All data and any property which has been received from
the State or purchased with funds provided for that purpose
under this Agreement, shall be the property of the State, and
shall be returned to the State upon demand or upon termination
of this Agreement for any reason.
10.3 Confidentiality of data shall be governed by N.H. RSA
chapter 91-A or other existing law. Disclosure of data requires
prior written approval of the State.

11. CONTR/VCTOR'S RELATION TO THE STATE. In the

performance of this Agreement the Contractor is in all respects
an independent contractor, and is neither an agent nor an
employee of the State. Neither the Contractor nor any of its
officers, employees, agents or members shall have authority to
bind the State or receive any benefits, workers' compensation or
other emoluments provided by the State to its employees.

12. ASSIGNMENT/DELEGATION/SUBCONTRACTS.

12.1 The Contractor shall not assign, or otherwise transfer any
interest in this Agreement without the prior written notice, which
shall be provided to the State at least fifteen (15) days prior to
the assignment, and a written consent of the State. For purposes
of this paragraph, a Change of Control shall constitute
assignment. "Change of Control" means (a) merger,
consolidation, or a transaction or series of related transactions in
which a third party, together with its affiliates, becomes the
direct or indirect owner of fifty percent (50%) or more of the
voting shares or similar equity interests, or combined voting
power of the Contractor, or (b) the sale of all or substantially all
of the assets of the Contractor.

12.2 None of the Services shall be subcontracted by the
Contractor without prior written notice and consent of the State.
The State is entitled to copies of all subcontracts and assignment
agreements and shall not be bound by any provisions contained
in a subcontract or an assignment agreement to which it is not a
party.

13. INDEMNIFICATION. Unless otherwise exempted by law,
the Contractor shall indemnify and hold harmless the State, its
officers and employees, from and against any and all claims,
liabilities and costs for any personal injury or property damages,
patent or copyright infringement, or other claims asserted against
the State, its officers or employees, which arise out of (or which
may be claimed to arise out oQ the acts or omission of the
Contractor, or subcontractors, including but not limited to the
negligence, reckless or intentional conduct. The Stale shall not
be liable for any costs incurred by the Contractor arising under
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this paragraph 13. Notwithstanding the foregoing, nothing herein
contained shall be deemed to constitute a waiver of the sovereign
immunity of the State, which immunity is hereby reserved to the
State. This covenant in paragraph 13 shall survive the
termination of this Agreement.

14. INSURANCE.

14.1 The Contractor shall, at its sole expense, obtain and
continuously maintain in force, and shall require any
subcontractor or assignee to obtain and maintain in force, the
following insurance;
14.1.1 commercial general liability insurance against all claims
of bodily injury, death or property damage, in amounts of not
less than $1,000,000 per occurrence and $2,000,000 aggregate
or excess; and
14.1.2 special cause of loss coverage form covering all property
subject to subparagraph 10.2 herein, in an amount not less than
80% of the whole replacement value of the property.
14.2 The policies described in subparagraph 14.1 herein shall be
on policy forms and endorsements approved for use in the State
of New Hampshire by the N.H. Department of Insurance, and
issued by insurers licensed in the Slate of New Hampshire.
14.3 The Contractor shall furnish to the Contracting OfTlcer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, a certificate(s) of
insurance for all insurance required under this Agreement.
Contractor shall also furnish to the Contracting Officer identified
in block 1.9, or his or her successor, certificatefs) of insurance
for all renewal(s) of insurance required under this Agreement no
later than ten (10) days prior to the expiration date of each
insurance policy. The certificate(s) of insurance and any
renewals thereof shall be attached and are incorporated herein by
reference.

15. WORKERS'COMPENSATION.

15.1 By signing this agreement, the Contractor agrees, certifies
and warrants that the Contractor is in compliance with or exempt
from, the requirements of N.H. R.SA chapter 281-A ("Workers'
Compensation ").
15.2 To the extent the Contractor is subject to the requirements
of N.H. RSA chapter 281-A, Contractor shall maintain, and
require any subcontractor or assignee to secure and maintain,
payment of Workers' Compensation in connection with
activities which the person proposes to undertake pursuant to this
Agreement. The Contractor shall furnish the Contracting Officer
identified in block 1.9, or his or her successor, proof of Workers'
Compensation in the manner described in N.H. RSA chapter
281-A and any applicable renewal(s) thereof, which shall be
attached and are incorporated herein by reference. The State
shall not be responsible for payment of any Workers'
Compensation premiums or for any other claim or benefit for
Contractor, or any subcontractor or employee of Contractor,
which might arise under applicable State of New Hampshire
Workers' Compensation laws in connection with the
performance of the Services under this Agreement.

16. NOTICE. Any notice by a party hereto to the other party
shall be deemed to have been duly delivered or given at the time
of mailing by certified mail, postage prepaid, in a United States
Post Office addressed to the parties at the addresses given in
blocks 1.2 and 1.4, herein.

17. AMENDMENT. This Agreement may be amended, waived
or discharged only by an instrument in writing signed by the
parties hereto and only after approval of such amendment,
waiver or discharge by the Governor and Executive Council of
the State ofNew Hampshire unless no such approval is required
under the circumstances pursuant to State law, rule or policy.

18. CHOICE OF LAW AND FORUM. This Agreement shall
be governed, interpreted and construed in accordance with the
laws of the State of New Hampshire, and is binding upon and
inures to the benefit of the parties and their respective successors
and assigns. The wording used in this Agreement is the wording
chosen by the parties to express their mutual intent, and no rule
of construction shall be applied against or in favor of any party.
Any actions arising out of this Agreement shall be brought and
maintained in New Hampshire Superior Court which shall have
exclusive jurisdiction thereof.

19. CONFLICTING TERMS. In the event of a conflict

between the terms of this P-37 form (as modified in EXHIBIT
A) and/or attachments and amendment thereof, the terms of the
P-37 (as modified in EXHIBIT A) shall control.

20. THIRD PARTIES. The parties hereto do not intend to
benefit any third parties and this Agreement shall not be
construed to confer any such benefit.

21. HEADINGS. The headings throughout the Agreement are
for reference purposes only, and the words contained therein
shall in no way be held to iexplain, modify, amplify or aid in the
interpretation, construction or meaning of the provisions of this
Agreement.

22. SPECIAL PROVISIONS. Additional or modifying
provisions set forth in the attached EXHIBIT A are incorporated
herein by reference.

23. SEVERABILITV. In the event any of the provisions of this
Agreement are held by a court of competent jurisdiction to be
contrary to any state or federal law, the remaining provisions of
this Agreement will remain in full force and effect.

24. ENTIRE AGREEMENT. This Agreement, which may be
executed in a number of counterparts, each of which shall be
deemed an original, constitutes the entire agreement and
understanding between the parties, and supersedes all prior
agreements and understandings with respect to the subject matter
hereof.
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EXHIBIT A

SPECIAL PROVISIONS

There are no special provisions of this contract.
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EXHIBIT B

SCOPE OF SERVICES

1. INTRODUCTION

Gemini Electric Inc, dba Power Up Generator Service Co. (hereinafter referred to as the
"Contractor") hereby agrees to provide the State of New Hampshire (hereinafter referred to as the
"State"), Department of Administrative Services, with Generator Maintenance and Repair Services in
accordance with the bid submission in response to State Request for Bid #2633-23 and as described
herein.

2. CONTRACT DOCUMENTS

This Contract consists of the following documents ("Contract Documents"):

a. State of New Hampshire Terms and Conditions,

b. EXHIBIT A Special Provisions
c. EXHIBIT B Scope of Services

d. EXHIBIT C Method of Payment

e. EXHIBIT D RFB 2633-23

f. EXHIBIT E Contractor's Bid Response

In the event of any conflict among the terms or provisions of the documents listed above, the
following order of priority shall indicate which documents control: (1) Form Number P-37 [as modified
In EXHIBIT A "Special Provisions,"), (2) EXHIBIT B "Scope of Services," (3) EXHIBIT C "Method of
Payment," (4) EXHIBIT D "RFB 2633-23," and (5) EXHIBIT E "Contractor's Bid Response."

3. TERM OF CONTRACT

The term of the contract shall commence on September 1, 2022 or upon approval of the Governor
and Executive Council, whichever is later, and shall continue through August 31, 2025, unless
extended for additional terms.

The contract may be extended for up to two (2) years under the same terms, conditions and pricing
structure upon the mutual agreement between the successful Contractor and the State with the
approval of the Governor and Executive Council.

4. SCOPE OF WORK

Contractor Responsibilities:

1. The Contractor shall not commence work until a conference is held with each state agency, at
which representatives of the Contractor and the State are present. The conference will be
arranged by the requesting state agency.

2. All generator maintenance and repair services shall be completed within fourteen (14)
calendar days (or within another mutually agreed upon timeframe) after a request by o Stote
agency.
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3. For semi-annual or annual services, the Contractor(s) shall submit a proposed service schedule
to each state agency requiring the services at least ten (10) calendar days prior to each semi
annual or annual period.

4. All services performed under this Contract shall be performed between the hours of 7:00 A.M.
and 4:00 P.M unless other arrangements are made in advance with the state agency. Any
deviation in work hours shall be pre-approved by the Business Administrator or his or her
designee. The State requires a ten day (10) advanced notice in order to provide security and
access to respective work areas.

5. The Contractor shall promptly report all deficiencies to the Business Administrator or his/her
designated representative. Request to repair and/or replace parts shall be approved in
advance by the Business Administrator or his/her designated representative prior to.any actual
work being performed by the Contractor. Parts, materials and labor shall be invoiced
separately. The State reserves the right to request the Contractor supply the State with invoices
from suppliers documenting the Contractor's actual cost.

6. Throughout the dur:ation of the contract, the Contractor shall maintain an inventory of (or have
readily available) spare parts to support the described systems.

7. The Contractor shall provide only replacement parts that are new and of the some quality and
brand name as that being replaced. Substitutions will be permitted only with prior written
authorization of the Business Administrator or his/her designated representative.

8. All repair services shall be conducted in full compliance with all specified standards in a
manner equal to or greater than the normal safety and security procedures and standards
established by the State, and at no time shall state facilities or its occupants be placed in
jeopardy.

9. The Contractor agrees that any damage or injury to buildings, materials, equipment or to other
property during the performance of this service will be repaired at their own expense. The State
shall require correction of defective work or damages to any part of a building or its
appurtenances when caused by the Contractor's employees, equipment or supplies. The
Contractor shall correct all defective work and damages to the State's satisfaction. If the
Contractor does not proceed promptly with the necessary corrections, the State may withhold
payments to the Contractor in the amount necessary to correct the defective work ond/or
damages.

10. All work must be performed in such a manner as not to inconvenience building occupants. The
Contractor shall determine the State's normal working conditions and activities in progress and
shall conduct the work in the least disruptive manner.

11. The Contractor shall employ a sufficient number of trained technicians so that all service calls
are answered promptly. The work staff shall consist of qualified persons completely familiar with
the products and equipment being serviced.

12. The Contractor shall furnish all personnel with uniforms, which shall be neat and clean in
appearance with picture identification that is visible at all times.
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13. The Contractor shell moke service avoilobie twenty-four (24) hour per day, seven (7) days per
week for emergency repairs.

14. All services shall comply with applicable standards as set forth by the National Fire Protection
Association (NFPA) 1 10; Standard for Emergency and Standby Power Systems and any state or
local fire codes.

15. The Contractor must produce documentation when biocide additive is added to the fuel
storage tank with quantity and ratio of additive.

16. The Contractor shall present a written summary of the work performed after each scheduled or
emergency call and before leaving the job site, and obtain the State's signature thereon.

17. The Contractor or their personnel shall not represent themselves as employees or agents of the
State.

18. While on State property, employees shall be subject to the control of the State, but under no
circumstances shall such persons be deemed to be employees of the State.

19. The Contractor's personnel shall observe all regulations or special restrictions in effect at the
state agency.

20. The Contractor's personnel shall be allowed only in areas where services are being performed.
The use of State telephones is prohibited.

21. The State reserves the right to require the Contractor to train, counsel or reassign any employee
the State deems incompetent, careless, insubordinate, or otherwise objectionable, or whose
continued employment on the work is deemed to be contrary to the public interest or
inconsistent with the best interest of security and the State.

22. RECORD OF INSPECTION: Upon completion of each scheduled testing and inspection service,
the Contractor shall provide a report of work performed to the respective Maintenance
Supervisor or his/her designee. The report shall contain specific information regarding
testing/inspection results of the identified equipment and/or devices within the system. The
report shall be submitted no later than ten (10) calendar days after completion of scheduled
service and a duplicate copy shall accompany the testing/inspection invoice.

23. The Contractor shall be completely responsible for their work, including any damages or
breakdowns caused by their failure to make/take appropriate action. Any expenses
associated with repairs shall be assessed to the Contractor.

24. The Contractor shall provide one (1) dispatch phone number that shall be available 24/7 for
emergencies.

25. The Contractor shall respond to the State by telephone to all emergency service calls within
fifteen (15) minutes of reported occurrence.

26. The Contractor shall physically respond to the site for all emergency service calls within four (4)
hours after report of occurrence with the following exceptions:
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Exceptions include;
a. Coos County Superior Court - acceptable response time is six (6) hours
b. NH Fish and Game Berlin Fish Hatchery - acceptable response time is one (1) hour
c. NH Fish and Game Warren Fish Hatchery - acceptable response time is one (1 ] hour

Note: If a facility generator at a turnpike location is still not operable within eight (8] hours of
initial notification, the Contractor shall supply a quote for a rental generator and associated
hook-up costs. The State reserves the right to procure a rental generator from another source.
Turnpike generators shall be fixed within one (1) week after being notified by the Agency, if not
fixed within that time frame the Contractor will be responsible for all rental cost thereafter. If the
delay of more than one (1) week is caused by the availability parts, the responsibility of rental
cost will be with DOT Turnpikes.

27. If sub-contractors ore to be utilized. Contractor shall provide information regarding the
proposed sub-contractors including the name of the company, their address, contact person
and three references for clients they ore currently servicing. Approval by the State must be
received prior to a sub-contractor starting any work.

State Responsibilities:
The State shall be responsible to provide reasonable means of access to all equipment
covered herin and promptly notify the Contractor of any malfunction in the system{s) that
comes to the State's attention. It is NOT the State's responsibility to provide transportation to
any of the generator locations. Please note: some locations ore Hike Access only, ATV Access
only.

ANNUAL MINOR/MAJOR RATE FOR TERM OF CONTRACT

Major Inspection to be performed one (1) time per calendar year. Service to include but is not limited
to:

INGITION Change all spark plugs
Change points
Change condenser
Check distributor cop and rotor and change. If necessary
Check oil ignition wires and replace, if necessary
Check start solenoid terminals

Check and adjust choke, when applicable

ENGINE Change lube oil
Change lube oil filter
Tighten valve covers
Fill governor sump with lube oil, when applicable
Lubricate governor linkage
Service oil both air cleaner, when applicable
Check entire unit for noticeable oil leaks

COOLING SYSTEM

Test coolant protection
Test coolant alkalinity
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EXHAUST SYSTEM

FUEL SYSTEM

Check water hoses - both upper ond lower
Check bypass hoses
Check ton belts

Check engine block heoter for operotion, when oppilcoble
Check louver operotion
Check woter filters

Chonge ontifreeze solution (onnuoiiy). For pricing purposes, this
service is limited to two (2) times per life of contract. Additional
antifreeze solution cFtanges will be subject to a charge.

Check flexible section for crocks or leoks

Droin condensotion trop, when oppilcoble
Check exhoust flonge goskets
Check exhousts muffler ond droin. when opplicoble
Vlsuolly inspect entire exhoust system for leoks

Chonge primory ond secondory fuel filter diesel only
Check injector fuel lines diesel only
Check flex fuel sections

Check fuel pump
Check fuel connections ond tighten
Check fuel solenoid

Check doy tonk floot
Check regulotor (Gos)
Add biocide odditive to fuel storoge tonk

BATTERY Lood test bottery

Check specific grovity of bottery
Check bottery voltoge
Clean battery cobles ond reploce
Cleon bottery terminol on cobles
Clean bottery posts and copt some
Check fluid level ond fill

Rechorge ond /or reploce

STARTING SYSTEM Check storter motor solenoid terminol

Check storter motor

Check chorge rot rote on alternator or internal charge circuit
Check alternator belt

ELECTRICAL Check exciter

Check voltoge regulotor
Check rototing diodes
Check rectifiers

Check brushes

Cleon collector rings
Cleon corbon deposits
Check SCRS
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OPERATIONAL CHECKS

following:

AUTOMATIC SWITCH

AUTOMATIC TRANSFER

SWITCHES (ATS)

FINAL CHECK

GENERAL

INSPECTION

OF SITE

Check control panel relays

Check wiring and terminals
Check solid-state boards for connections

Start generator and conduct safety shutdown tests for the

Low oil pressure

High water temperature
Over speed
High air temperature, air-cooled sets only
Check voltage output
Check frequency (Hz)
Record hour meter reading, when applicable
Check unit for vibration and any unusual noises
Run unit full building load-minimum of thirty (30) minutes

Inspect contactor assembly and connections
Check exerciser clock and time setting

Check time delays

Check battery charger for proper output
Check selector switch

Check voltage sensors for visual condition
Start and stop generator from transfer switch

Check cannections

Inspect or test for evidence of overheating and excessive contact
erosion

Remove dust and dirt

Inspect and/or replace contacts when required
Infrared testing/inspection under load

Check field breaker is in the ON position
Check that selector switch is in the automatic mode

Start and stop generator using generator controls
Start and stop generator using the switch controls
Start and stop generator using exerciser clock

•Receive prior approval from supervisory personnel before
performing this function.

Reset generator and leave set in the remote position

Inspect site for any debris or obstructions, which could cause a
potential
Problem or may be hazardous to the operation or surrounding
area.

Report any problems to the Agency Contact Person.

This major inspection includes ports, lubricants, coolants, material or labor used in any of the above
service level maintenance programs.
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* Minor Inspection to be performed one (1) time per calendar year, approximately six (6) months
after the Major Inspection*.

A. Visually check and subsequently operate the system under full load
conditions for a minimum of 30 Minutes, after informing the residential staff
that the test will be performed.

B. Confirm that all circuits powered by the system ore functioning fully and
moke any required deficiency repairs

C. Verify that all safety devices are functioning properly.
D. Verify that the governor/controller is adjusted for proper voltage and

frequency.

E. For additional service, other than above, on hourly repair rate will be utilized.

*Any parts, coolants or materials unrelated to the inspection, must be approved by the Agency
Contact.

*load Testing with Load Bank Will be performed at the request of the location agency. This is
intended to reduce Wet Stacking within the exhaust system.

The contract price and test minimum will be based on the standards specified in the 2019 NFPA 110
Section 8.4.2.3* this minimum will follow any amendments or modifications that NFPA may moke over
the term of the contract.

Additional run times and load percentages may be requested by the agency or suggested by the
Contractor or based on manufacturer recommendations. The additional service may be established on
the monthly generator exercise requirements specified in 2019 NFPA 110 8.4 and manufacturer
recommendations.

Load Testing Services shall be fully discussed and mutually agreed upon by the utilizing agency and
Contractor prior to any work commencing.

SERVICE RATES (REPAIR/EMERGENCY SERVICES!

Repair Services:
•  Contractor shall quote the standard hourly rote, from Exhibit C, for all parts, labor [per

hour/person) for generator repair services that are not covered under the major and minor
inspections. All labor rotes shall start when Contractor's personnel arrives at the work site and
end when Contractor's personnel leaves the work site.

•  State Agencies may elect to hove ATS repair/emergency work completed by the original
manufacturer or another ATS specialized contractor.

•  Repair/Emergency service rotes will apply to generator locations not listed on this contract.

Emergency Services:
•  Contractor shall quote standard hourly rote, 4:01 P.M. to 6:59 A.M., Saturday, Sunday, and

Holiday. All labor rotes shall start when Contractor's personnel arrives at the work site and end
when Contractor's personnel leaves the work site.

•  Mileage and travel expenses for repair/emergency services shall be built into the
repair/emergency services hourly rote in Exhibit C. No mileage or travel expenses con be
added separately to the invoice.

Repair Parts Discount

Repair Ports Catalog
Repair parts used for repair shall be no more than ten percent (10%) over cost and held firm.
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5. OBLIGATIONS AND LIABILITY OF THE CONTRACTOR

The Contractor shall provide generator maintenance and repair services strictly pursuant to, and in
conformity with, the specifications described in State RFB #2633-23, as described herein, and under
the terms of this Contract.

It is the responsibility of the Contractor to maintain this contract and New Hampshire Contractor
Registration with up to dote contact information.

Contract specific contact information (Soles contact. Contractor contract manager, etc.) shall be
sent to the State's Contracting Office listed in Box 1.9 of Form P-37.

Additionally, all updates i.e., telephone numbers, contact names, email addresses, W9, tax
identification numbers are required to be current through a formal electronic submission to the
Bureau of Purchase and Property at:
htlDs://das.nh.aov/Durchasina/Contractorreaistration/fS(aQfzcv55ahaeas45iDva5i451)/welcome.aspx

The Contractor shall agree to hold the State of NH harmless from liability arising out of injuries or
damage caused while performing this work. The Contractor shall agree that any damage to
building(s), materials, equipment or other property during the performance of the service shall be
repaired at its own expense, to the State's satisfaction.

6. DEBARMENT. SUSPENSION. INELIGIBILITY AND VOLUNTARY EXCLUSION LOWER TIER COVERED

TRANSACTIONS

The Contractor certifies, by signature of this contract, that neither it nor its principals is presently
debarred, suspended, proposed for deborment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from
participation in this transaction by any Federal Department or Agency.

7. CONFIDENTIAUTY & CRIMINAL RECORD

If requested by the using agency, the Contractor and its employees, and Sub-Contractors (if any),
shall be required to sign and submit a Confidential Nature of Department Records Form and a
Criminal Authorization Records Form. These forms shall be submitted to the individual using agency
prior to the start of any work.
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EXHIBIT C

METHOD OF PAYMENT

1. CONTRACT PRICE

The Contracfor hereby agrees to provide Generator Rental services In complete compliance with the terms and conditions
specified in Exhibit B foran amount up to and not to excee.d a price of t300.000.00: this figure shall not be considered a guaranteed
or minimum figure: however if shall be considered a maximum figure from the effective dale through the expiration dote as
indicated in Form P-37 Block 1.7.

2. PRICING STRUCTURE

DOS Stole

Police
Troop C

ISAiJi Brook

Court
Keene Kohler 100 REOZJB Dieiel Cheshre

v«3.m 1130.00 V3a3.00 11.30.00 loai.oo 11.10.00 1480.00

DOS Stole

Police
Hyfond Ha

Hykirtd Hi
Rd

Weslmorelond 1

CAT

C2Clf3S
20 KW

EI2I67 Propane Cheshke

visa.oo 11.30.00 i.\5a.oo 11.10.00 13.58.00 1130.00 n/o

CX)T

Dbtiict i

Potrol 401-

Fuel Sile

107

Ctoremont

Rd

CFiorleslowrt 1 Kohler 30REOZJC Diesel Cheshre

S3S8.00 11.30.00 i.\5a.oo 1130.00 13.58.CO 1130.00 1315.0)

DOT

Ost'ict 4

Mclnt.

MB 4l>

ftlndge
1972

RoulellP
Rirxfge I Kohler 20 REOZJB Diesel Cheshke

1350.00 1130.00 1350.CO 1130.00 1358.00 1130.C0 1»5.00

DOT

Ditlricl4

MOk^l.

DO-

Swoniey
IPBoseHa

Rd
Swonzey ,1 OMAN 30DEH . Diesel Cheshke

■1303.00 1130.00 1383.00 11».€0 1383.00 1130.00 1315.0)

DNCR
Surrvnlt ot
Mi Piiche*

R1 123 N Stoddord 1
Col

Olyfhpl
on

G351G ' ' LP , Cheshke
13B3.00 1130.00 1383.00 1130.00 1383.00 1130.00 n/o

Oepl.ol
Mlltorv

and
Vetefom
AtloH

Beflln RC
2169 River

Side Di,
Berlin 1

CummJ
ngi
Pwr

Gen

ICO
GSGAA

Diesel Coos

1450.00 1130.C0 1450.00 1130.00 1450.00 1130.00 1400.00
Deot.ol
Mlltory
ond

Veierani

Alloin

LorKOilet
RC

532 Moin $1. LorKoiler 1

Commi
ngi
Pwr
Gen

100
GSGAA Diesel Coos

14SO.OO 1130.00 1450.00 1130.00 1450.00 1130.00 1400.00
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Dept. P<
Conpciio

n$

Nofttwn

NHCor

Foclify

138 E. Mllon

Rood
Berlin 3

Coterp
■or

3412SR4B Diesel Coos
S.S.S37.00 5390.C0 55.537.00 5,390.00 55.537.00 5390.CO 52925.00

Dept. ol
Correcilo

nj

NorfFiem
NH Cor
Foclify

138E.f.Uon
Rood

Berlin 1 toNer ICOREOZJB Diesel Coos
• 1 S42S.OO 5I30.<X 5425.00 5130.00 5425.00 5130.00 5400.00

DOS Stole
Polce

Troop F S<9 Route
302

IMn Mountoln 1
Koetsle
rSOKW 50 RE0ZJ8 Diesel Coos

J425.00 5130.C0 5425.00 5I30.00 5425.00 5130.00 5430.00

DOS State
Poke

Holden HI
(Drtve

Access)

ii*M'4a.6T
N.

7f20'2S.I4-
w

W,

Stev^rtstovih
1

CAT
G2C1FS3
20 KW

EI2I62 Propane Coos

S3S8.00 5130.00 v\5a.co 5130.00 5358.00 5130.00 n/o

OOJ
Oistrlcl 1

CotymbJo
Potroi
Sfied

8 Grant
Rood

Coiumbio 1 tohler 30REOZJC Diesel Coos
S358.00 5130.00 5.\5a.00 5130.00 5358.00 5130.00 5315.00

001
Otslrlet 1

Gortyjm
Potroi
Stred

I Mortn
Drive

Gertsom 1 tohier 30REO2JC Diesel Coos
S3.5a.X 5I30.CO 5358.00 51.30.00 5358.00 5130.CO 531.5.00

001
Dislrlcl 1

Lorscosfet
FocBiies

641 MolnSI.
U.S. Rte 3

Loncoster 1 tohler 50REOZJB Diesel Coos
5425.00 5130.00 5425.00 5130.CO 5425.00 5130.00 5430.00

DOl
CHltrtct 1

Twfn Mt.
Fuei

Foclify

SCO Route
302 West

Twin Mounloin 1 Kohler 16REYG Propone Coos
5358.00 5130.00 5350.00 '5130.00 5358.00 5130.00 n/o

ONCR
SummJI of
Mkn Mtn

1106 MIon 1
Col

Otympl
on

GiOlG LP Coos
5356.00 5130.00 5358.00 5130.00 5358.00 5130.00 rs/o

ONCR
OMtlpn of

Portj

Mt.
Woshjnglo
n sumrnft

PO BoxD Gorham 2

Coterp
■or

Otympl
on

0200P3 Kerosene Coos

51.794.00 52AO.OO 51.294,00 57MT.OO 51.294.00 5240.00 51.140.00

ONCR
DKotion of

Ports

Greol N.
Woods
Areo

Ecterd Woy Slewortstown 1
Kotoiig

hi
50KW Pertins

Diesel
Coos

5358.00 Sl.TO.m 5.150.00 5130.00 5358.00 5130.00 5430.00

NH F & G
Berlin Yort Pond

Rd
Berlin 1

Gener
oc

45KW Propone Coos
5425.00 5130.00 5425.00 5I».00 5425.00 5130.(» n/a

NHPiG
Berlin Yort Pond

Rd
Berlin

Gener
oc

ICOKW Propane Coos
5425.00 5130.00 5425.00 51.30.00 5425.00 5130.00 n/rs

Dept.ot
Mlitary

OrxJ
Veterans

Leborcn
RC

174 Healer
Rd.

LeOonon
Kohier

PWT
Gen

lOOREOZJF Diesel Grotton

.  5455.00 5I30.C0 54S5.C0 5130.00 5455.00 5130.00 5480.00

Dept.ot
Mlitory

orx)
Velerons

little ton
RC

350
Meadow

Rd.
Ul lie Ion

Cumrrf
ngs
Pwr

Gen

100
GSGAA

1'
'' Diesel ; Grolton

•  5455.00 5130.00 54.5.5.00 5130.00 5455.00 5130.00 54fl0.ra

Dept.ot
Mlitory
or^

Ply month
RC

19 Armory
Rd

Ptymoutts

Currvnl
ngs
Pwr

Gen

too
GSGAA

Diesel Grotty
54.5.5.00 5130.00 ■ 54.5.5.00 5130.00 5455.00 51.30.00 54SO.OO
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ValetDm

AMoh

DHMJ
Clencltl

Hooie
393HlonSi. benion 3

Coteip

■or

CI50 Prime
Power

Oleiet < Grotton
3204800 1390.00 12.048.® 1390.® 12.048.® 1320.® 11.520®

DHHS
Oleneiitt
Home

• 323 High Si. benlon 1
Coterp

Dkir
60llTe
Sotety Oieiei . Grotton

UB3C0 1130.00 1.383.® St®.® 1.383.® It®.® 1440.®

DOS Stola
Poice

Tenney
Mounioln

Ptymoulh 1
CAT

G20f3S
20 KW

EI2I65 • Proporw Grotton

S383.0O lt.10.00 1383.® It®.® 1383.® It®.® n/o

DOS Stole
PoSce

Moote

Mounloin
Eino t

CAT
G20f3S
20 KW

EI2I61 Prooone Grotton L

,  tmoo 1130.® 1383.® lt».® 1383.® It®.® n/o

OOI
Delrlci 1

BulIerNI
PotroJ
Shed

327 Buiiert4
Rd

Fronconio 1
Guordi

on
54160 Propone -  Oration

1383.00 ll».® 1383.® it».ro 1383.® It®.® n/o

001
Oislrici 1

Uttle'on
Potfot
Shed

201 Oeb
Rood

III lie ton 1 Kohler
»KVA-
30REOZ7C

Oletel Grotton
1383.00 It®.® 1383.® It®.® 1383.® It®.® 13I.S.®

oot
Oblrlcl 1

EfTOl Pofrol
Shed

143 Dom Rd., ^  EetTot 1 Kohlef
20KVA-
20REOZJC

Diesel Grotton t
l.W.Ofl it.®.® 1383.CO It®.® 1383.® ItM.® 1®5.®

OOI
CHltrtcl 1

Pinkfiom
Polrol
Shed

462 Rl. 16.
Plnkhom'i

Ciont
Gertxim 1 Kohtef

; •

20KVA -
20fiEOZJC

Diesel
1
Grotton

1383.00 IIX.® 1383.® 11®.® 1383.® It®.® 1®5.®

DOT
0<itriet2

PS 205-
Conoon RT)18 - Conoon

Onon
7.5 ICW

705Jb-
3R/273IR

Prooor^e Grotton
1383.CO It®.® 1383.® 11®.® 1383.® St®.® n/o

OOT
Dbtriet2

PS 204-
Havert4

3375
Oorlmouth

Coiege
Hwy

Hoverhl
KoNer
2005

25 kw Inti Diesel Grotton

Vlfl.3.00 lt®TO 1.383.® 11®.® 1383.® ItM.® 1310.®

OOT
Obtricl2

Obtricl
Ofllce-
Enlleld

6 Eoilmon
HI Rood

EnriekJ
Wlnco

1288
35 kw

lOO-go
slond-
dlone

Grotton

1383.00 it®ra 1383.® It®.® 1383.® 11.®.® 13».®

OOT
Obtr<cl2

PS 202-
Wenlworlh

465 Eon
side Rood

Wentwotlh
tCotiler
2005

25 kw
Init Diesel

Tonk
Grotton

1383.00 it»® 1383.® it».m 1383.® 11®.® 1310.®

DOT
ObtrictS

PS 325-
Thorn loo

22
toundromol

Orh«
Thomlon Kotiler SORZGb Propone. Grotton

1422.00 it®n 1422.® It®.® 1422.® 11®.® n/o
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DNCR

Loloystis

Place

Comp Gr

14 loloyette
Compgroun

dRO

LincoRt kohief S0PE2G LPGoi Gfotton

1383.CO 5130.00 5383.00 51M.C0 5383.00 5IX.C0 n/o

ONCR

Connon

Mt. Skt

Seoilc
Pumo
Slollon

Froncor>ia

Notch SI Pk
FrorKonIo 1

8rioo»
&

Sltollo

n

01615

12KW
IP Gmtion

•  S^.OO SIX.CO 5383.01 51X.OO 5383.CO 51X.C0 n/o

ONCR

Connon

Ml. Ski

Summit

Slollon

FrorKonlo

Notch SI Pk
frorwonlo 1

Coterp
Bar

OlympI
on

9SA02is2
lOOKW

Propone Grollon

5383.00 51M.C0 5383.C0 5IX.OO 5383.00 5I.X.X n/o

ONCR
Connon

Ml, Ski-

A/so

From

Control

Posuer

Fronconio

Noleh SI Pk
fronconio I Kohler

1SRE02K

liXW
Oletel Grollon

5490.CO 5130.00 5490.00 5IX.W 5490.00 51M.OO 5315.ra

ONCR
Connon

Ml. Ski

Also

From

Voley

Slollon

fronconio

Notch St Pk
FrorKonlo 1 Kohier ,

40REO2K
42>;w

Diesel Grolton

5S9S.CO 5130.00 5595.00 5IX.OO 5595.00 51X00 53X.m

ONCR

Connon

Ml. Ski

From

Control

Hydro

fronconio

Notch SI Pk
FrorKonio 2

Cummi

ni
SISO Diesel Grollon

51.740.00 5260.00 51.240.00 5260.00 51.240.00 5260.00 5700.ro

NH F & G

Wotien

Fbh

Hoicheiy

NH Rouie 25 Worien Wlnco
PSS1200-C.
10KW

Propane Grollon

•  5383.00 51M.00 5383.00 5IX.00 5383.00 si.x.m n/o

NHF&G

Worren

Fbh

Hoichety

NH Route 25 Worren 1
Coterp
Oor

G25UH3 Propane Grollon

5383.00 51».C0 5383.» 5IX.W 5383 00 51X.X n/o

001

OislricI 2

PS 213-

Sunbpjse
e Poll Offic'e'

Pood'
SunooM

K^er
<  2006'

12 kw
kill 0>«el

1  Fonk
tSuB'on

5.\S.S.OO 5IX.C0 '5355.00 5I.X.OO 5355.0O. 51X.» 53ob.ro

ONCR '
Sorlrtglleld
Rsti Also

.  • ,

northbour>d '
mie mork 42

Sorlngflekl 1

Oiwn

1000B

OG

2000

lOTkw
; kill Diesel'

Fonk ■
Su^n. j 1

• 5355.(» 'si.x.m 5355.00 51X.OO •  515S.£0 .51X00 .; 5480.00

3. INVOICE

Itemized invoices shall be submitted to the individual agency after the completion of the job/services and shoil include a brief
description of the work done along with the location of work.

Contractor shall be paid within thirty (30) days after receipt of property documented invoice and acceptance of the work to the
State's sotisfaction.
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4. PAYMENT

Payments may be made via ACH or P-Card. Use the following link to enroll with the State Treasury
for ACH payments: https://www.nh.gov/treasury
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EXHIBIT D

RFB #2633- 23 is incorporated here within.
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EXHIBIT E

Contractor's bid is incorporated here within
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State of New Hampshire

Department of State

CERTIFICATE

1, David M. Scanlan, Secretary of State of the State ofNew Mampshire, do hereby certify that GEMINI ELECTRIC, INC. is

a New Hampshire Profit Corporation registered to transact business in New Hampshire on May 21, 1990. 1 further certify that all

fees and documents required by the Secretary of State's office have been received and is in good standing as far as this office is

concerned.

Business ID: 160612

Certificate Number: 0005839071

0&

i
y
mflA_

■B.

IN TESTIMONY WHEREOF,

I hereto set my hand and cause to be afilxcd

the Seal of the State of New Hampshire,

this 3rd day of August A.D. 2022.

David M. Scanlan

Secretary of State



Power Up

Genwator
Service Co.

Power Up Generator Service Company

8 Priscilla Lane, Auburn, NH 03032

603-657-9080, fax 603-657-9082

www.powerupgener3torservice.com

Certificate of Corporate Secretary

The undersigned, being the Secretary of Gemini Electric, Inc. (dba Power Up Generator Service Co.) a New Hampshire
Corporation (the corporation) herby certifies that the Directors of the Corporation, by unanimous consent, have
authorized the corporation do the following;

Resolved;

1. Execute all necessary documents and contracts.

Matthew C. Connors is authorized to execute requ/red documants to effect purpose of this resolution.

(Secretary 7/5/22

''nmuu

tness) 7/5/22



AC^Rcf CERTIFICATE OF LIABILITY INSURANCE
DATE (MM/OOrYYYY)

06/21/2022

THIS CERTIFICATE IS ISSUED AS A MATTER OF INFORMATION ONLY AND CONFERS NO RIGHTS UPON THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER. THIS
CERTIFICATE DOES NOT AFFIRMATIVELY OR NEGATIVELY AMEND, EXTEND OR ALTER THE COVERAGE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES
BELOW. THIS CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE DOES NOT CONSTITUTE A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE ISSUING INSURER(S). AUTHORIZED
REPRESENTATIVE OR PRODUCER. AND THE CERTIFICATE HOLDER.

IMPORTANT: If the certificate holder is an ADDITIONAL INSURED, the policyfios) must have ADDITIONAL INSURED provisions or be endorsed.
If SUBROGATION IS WAIVED, subject to the terms and conditions of the policy, certain policies may require an endorsement A statement on
this cortificate does not confer rights to the certificate holder in lieu of such ondoraement(s).

PRODUCER

Optisure Risk Partner, LLC

d/b/a /kspen Insurance Agency

40 Stark Street

Mancnester nh 03i0i

COMTACT Htaren Case

(603)647-0800 (603)547-0330

AwiRFss- Karen.CaseOOptisure.com

INSURER(S)AFFORDINO COVERAGE NAIC »

INSURER A - Selective Insurance Company

INSURED

Gemini Electric inc, DBA: Power Up Generator Services Company

6 Prisdlia Lane

Auburn NH 03032

INSURER B :

INSURER C ;

INSURER D;

INSURER E:

INSURER F:

TBSR
LTR

THIS IS TO CERTIP*' THAT THE POLICIES OF INSURANCE LISTED BELOW HAVE BEEN ISSUED TO THE INSURED NAMED ABOVE FOR THE POLICY PERIOD
INDICATED. NOTWITHSTANDING ANY REQUIREMENT, TERM OR CONDITION OF ANY CONTRACT OR OTHER DOCUMENT WITH RESPECTTO WHICH THIS
CERTIFICATE MAY BE ISSUED OR MAY PERTAIN, THE INSURANCE AFFORDED BY THE POLICIES DESCRIBED HEREIN IS SUBJECT TO ALL THE TERMS.
EXCLUSIONS AND CONDITIONS OF SUCH POLICIES. LIMITS SHOWN MAY HAVE BEEN REDUCED BY PAID CLAIMS.

WDCYEVTTOOTSDSR pocicreFr
TYPE OF INSURANCE IWSO

X COMMERCUL GENERAL LIABILITY

OCCURCLAIMS-MADE

GENt AGGREGATE LIMIT APPLIES PER:

PRO
JECTPOLICY

OTHER:

WVD POLICY NUMBER

S 2400493

(MM/DD/YYYY)

07/01/2022

(MM/Dorrrro

07/01/2023

EACH OCCURRENCE

DAMAGE TO RENTED
PREMISES <Ea oeeufr«ne»1

MED EXP (Any on< py»en)

PERSONAL A AOV INJURY

GEN ERAL AGGREGATE

PROCXJCTS • COMP/OP AGO

Pollution S1,000 deG

COMOINEO SINGLE UMIT

1,000,000

500,000

15,000

1.000.000

2,000,000

2,000,000

1.000.000

AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY

ANY AUTOX

fEi lecloul)
1,000,000

X

X

BOOILY INJURY (P*r p«r«on)

OWNED
AUTOS ONLY
HIRED
AUTOS ONLY X

UMBRELLA LIAB

EXCESS LIAB

SCHEDULED
AUTOS
NON-OWNED
AUTOS ONLY

S 2400493 07/01/2022 07/01/2023 BODILY INJURY (P»( Kddant)

PROPERTY DAMAGE
(P»r acckrtnll

X OCCUR

CLAJMS-MAOE

EACH OCCURRENCE
10,000,000

S 2400493 07/01/2022 07/01/2023 AGGREGATE
10,000,000

OED I X RETENTION $
WORKERS COMPENSATION,

AND EMPLOYERS' LIABIUTY

ANY PROPRIETOR/PARTNER/EXECUnVE
OFFICER/MEMBER EXCLUDED?
(Mandilery In NH)
Ifysi, under
DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS below

t t n

VYC 90S3018 07/01/2022 07/01/2023
E,L, EACH ACCIDENT

500,000

E.L, DISEASE • EA EMPLOYEE
500,000

E.L. DISEASE - POLICY LIMIT
500,000

DESCRIPTION OF OPERATIONS/LOCATIONS/VEHICLES (ACOfiO 101, AddlUonel Remertte Schedule, mey be elUched II more tpeeele rerjuired)

RE: /Vinual Generator Contract

Slate of New Hampshire Administrative Services

25 Capitol Street, Room 102

Concord NH 03301

1

SHOULD ANY OF THE ABOVE DESCRIBED POLICIES BE CANCELLED BEFORE
THE EXPIRATION DATE THEREOF, NOTICE WILL BE DELIVERED IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE POLICY PROVISIONS.

AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE

ACOR0 2S (2016/03) The ACORO name and logo arc registered marks of ACORO


